
Association, shall be chosen at the same time,
and in the same way as the officers, who shall
have charge of the business of thé Association.

Sec. 6.-If any vacancy occurs in the offices, it
shall be filled by ballot at the next meeting of
the A ssociation. -

ARTICLE IV.

Sec. 1.-Within the two weeks next succeeding
the annual meeting the, President, after consul-
tation with the Secretary, shall appoint the fol-
lowing committees. (1) A devotional committee,
who shall have charge of the regular de-votional
meetings of the Association, appointing leaders,
and suggesting topics for prayers and conference.
(2) A committee to vis't and provide for the sick
and needy. (3) A. committee to provide suitable
enter taiinments, social and otherwise.

Sec. 2.- 'Special committees for other purposes
may be provided for, and their work defined by
vote of the committee. They shall be appointed
in the same way as the Standing committees.

Sec. 3.-Unless otherwise ordered, all com-
mittees shall consist of three members each.
They shall report to the committee when required
and to the Association at each regular meeting.

Sec. 4.-The President and Secretary shall be

exoffic o members of all committees.

ARTICLE V.

Sec. 1.-The annual meeting shall be held on the
16th of October. A public anniversary shall b.e


