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All times hereafter, shall be able and capable to "lave, take, receive
purchase and acquire, hold, possess, enjoy ana maintain, to and
for the use of the said corporation, all lands and property, mova-
ble and immovable, which are now hold in trust for it, or which
may hereafter be sold, ceded, exchanged, given, bequeathed or
granted to the said corporation, provided that the annual revenue
of the said corporation do not exceed ten thousand dollars • or to
aeU, alienate, convey, let or lease the same if need be. '

8. The officers of the said Corporation shall consist of a
President, Vice-president, one Secretary, a Treasurer, a commit-
tee of Management not to exceed five in number, and auch other
officers as shall, from time to time, seem necessary to the corpo-
ration. The said nine to be chosen by the association at an annual
meeting called for that purpose between the first of February and
firstof March of each ynar, and the said nine shall choose thoir
officers as above from among themselves at a subsequent meeting.

The persons hereinafter named to wit : Jeremiah Gallagher,
Thomas Coolican, Jeremiah Horan, Thaddeus J. Walsh, John
Dunn, William II. LaRooho, John O'Dowd, John Doogan, Robert
II. McGreevy and John Lane, shall be a provisional Committee
for the purpose of carrying out the provisions of this act, namely

:

the preparing the necessary by-lpws, and calling a meeting of the
Members of the said Corporation for the purpose of electine
officers.

*

4. The said Corporation shall have power to pass by-laws not
inconsistent with the laws of the province for fixing the terms of
admission of its members, for the government of the same, for the
electaon of, changing and altering the officers above named, and
for the general regulation and management of its affairs, and for
carrying out the object of the said act of incorporation, which
by-laws, when passed and adopted at a regular meeting, shall,
unv.l modified or rescinded, be equally binding as this act upon
the corporation, its officwrs and members.


