
COMMONS DEBATES

Order Paper Questions

what was the total dollar value of cach contract and what was
the actual amount paid (c) in each case, did Loto Canada
purchase, lease or rent, and if leased or rented, what were the
terms and length of the ]case or rental (d) did Loto Canada
use the service or advice of any government department,
agency, subsidiary or agent in its employ for negotiation of any
of the contracts and, if so, for which contracts (e) in each case,
was the contract finalized by a negotiated settlement and, if
not, for what length of time will the conhract run?

9. Did Loto Canada in preparation for its lottery system (or
Loto Select), hire employees for the servicing, maintenance,
operation and administration of the lottery game and, if so (a)
how many and in what classifications (b) on what date (c) at
what annual rates of pay (d) in which cities were they to be
located'?

10. Was Loto Select Loto Canada's first experience with
operating a computer lottery gaming systeni and, if so, how
did Loto Canada determine the rate of pay of each classifica-
tion group to be employed by Loto Select?

I1. Did Loto Canada pay for the training of its employees
for Loto Select over and above their regular salaries and, if so
(a) in what locations were they trained and on what dates (b)
what expenses were paid for hotel accommodations, meals,
transportation, entertainment, telecommunications with their
home centre and other services'?

12. Did Loto Canada in preparation for its entry into a
computer lottery gaming system (or Loto Select), enter into
any contract with telecommunications networks between (a)
cities in Canada (b) Canada and any other country and, if so,
between which cities and/or countries and at what cost?

Return tabled.

Question No. 326--Mr. Dick:

1. Was a decision made by Loto Canada to remove itself
from a computer lottery gaming system (or Loto Select) and,
if so (a) on what date (b) who made the decision'?

2. Were employees hired for Loto Select or by any compa-
nies under Loto Canada's direct control laid off by Loto
Canada after the decision to remove itself from the computer
lottery and, if so, how many and on what dates?

3. (a) By category or classification, what amount in salaries
did Loto Canada pay to employees hired for the servicing,
maintenance, operation and administration of Loto Select (b)
how many reccived severance pay and what was the total
amount'?

4. Was a dismissed or laid-off employee of Loto Select
required to sign any agreement or oath of secrecy that he/she
would not divulge, discuss or disclose any information that
he/she had acquired regarding Loto Select while in the employ
of Loto Canada or of any company under its direction or
control in order to collect his/her severance pay'?

5. Prior to the decision by Loto Canada to remove itself
from a computer lottery gaming system (or Loto Select), did

[ Mr Dick j

the cabinet pass orders in council which in any way affected or
touched upon any of the contracts or employees of Loto
Canada involved or relating to its entrance into or removal
from the lottery system and, if so, which ones were passed and
on what dates?

6. Were there any clauses in the contract with General
Instruments for the provision of a computer lottery gaming
system (or Loto Select), stating a dollar figure for penalty or
liquidated damages if Loto Canada were to back out of the
contract and, if so, what were the terms of the clauses and the
dollar figure'?

7. Were there any clauses in the contract with General
Instruments for the provision of equipment for a computer
lottery gaming system (or Loto Select), stating a dollar figure
for penalty or liquidated damages if General Instruments was
unable to deliver the equipment contracted for by the date
agreed on and, if so, what were the terms of the clauses and
the dollar figure'?

8. Did it become apparent to Loto Canada, the government
or any subsidiary or agent in its employ, that General Instru-
ments would be unable to meet the contracted date of delivery
of equipment, terminals and computers for use in Loto Select'?

9. Did Loto Canada, the government or any subsidiary or
agent in its employ take into account or know that Consolidat-
cd Computer Incorporated and Digital Computers would be
able to deliver equipment, terminals and computers prior to
the date of delivery in its contract with the province of Ontario
for a computer lottery gaming system and, if so, on what date
was this taken into account or was such information known'?

10. Did Loto Canada or the government in return for
removing itself from a computer lottery gaming system, reach
an agreement with the province of (a) Ontario (b) Quebec for
the province to pay $500,000 towards costs incurred by Loto
Canada in extricating itself from its commitments other than
the General Instruments contract'?

I1. Did the province of Ontario and/or the province of
Quebec receive, free of any further charge, any of the consult-
ing services, furniture, office space, leasehold improvements,
advertising, promotional materials, tickets or information
pamphlets, display boards, or any other product, article or
service acquired by Loto Canada l'or use in Loto Select in
return for their commitment to contribute $500,000 each
towards costs incurred by Loto Canada in extricating itself
from contracts other than the General Instruments contract?

12. Did any other province contribute funds toward the costs
incurred by Loto Canada in extricating itself from its con-
tracts related to Loto Select and, if so, which provinces and
what was their contribution'?

13. Did Loto Canada, the government or any subsidiary,
department or agent in their employ or on their behalf, enter
into negotiations with General Instruments to extricate Loto
Canada from its contract with General Instruments and, if so,
on what date'?

14. Did Loto Canada resolve and finalize its contract with
General Instruments and, if so, on what date'?

Novemnber 21, 19791556


