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NEWS FROM THE HOME FIELD.
DIOCESE OF NOVA SCOTIA.

ALBION MINE.-On Sunday, the 9th, the
Encyclical letter of the Laumbeth Conference
was read in Christ Clhurcb, and prayers and
hymns were offered for the Bishop on the sea.

AMHERT.-A very pleasing Garden party
was held on Thursday, the 29th alt., on the
beautiful grounds of J. M. Townshend, Esq., in
aid of the Church Fund. The grounds were
prettily decorated with Chinese lanterns and no
effort was spared by the Committee to make it
a success. The members of the Brass Band
(wbo are always to the fore in any good under-
taking) kindly discoursed sweet music during
the evening. The gross amount realized was
about $'0.

The Annual Flower service in connection
with Christ Church Sunday-school was held on
Sun 'ay mornirg. the 2nd inst., at ten a.m., and
on the following Wednesday, the Sunday-school
pienie was held. The obildren were treated to
a short trip on the train as far as ' Au Lac,"
when they were feasted npon the good things
of this life, and indulged in games, &o.

DIOCESE OF FREDERICTON.

PERasONAL .- The Rtev. Canon Neales, M.A.,
Rector of Woodstock, has gone on a well earned
holiday te Massachusetts. He is expected to
return the early part of October.

The Rev. Horace Dibblee, Deacon in charge
at Maugervillo, is at bis home, Woodstock, on
a visit. During bis absence from his charge
bis services are supplied by the Rev. Mr. Ster.
ling, the former Rector of Maugerville.

The 11ev. Jas. SimondS, who bas been spend-
ing the summer with bis numerous friends in
Nova Scotia and New 3runswick, returned to
hie charge at Pomona, Cal., on the 4th aist.

SHEDIAC.-SO rarely is anything ever seen in
the GUARDIAN as regards the progress of the
Church in this place, that your correspondent
nust be excused, if trespassing too much on
valuable space, to express the great satisfaction
experienced in attending latoly several services
in St. Martin's in the Wood. The grand oid
service doar to the heart of every loyal child of
the Churcb. was couducted with reverence and
dignity; the responses and singing warm and
hearty, and would put to blush many a congre.
gation of more pretentions. Your correspond.
ent had the pleasure of hearing sermons from
Riev. Father Davenport, of the Mission Chapel,
St. John, who was spending a few weeks in this
popular summer resort ; also 1Rev. A. J. Reid,
ourate of St. Paul's, St. John. There is an ad-
ministration of Holy Communion every alter
nata Sunday at 8 o'clock, except on the first
Sunday in the month, when it is administered
at the 11 a.m. service at St. Andrew's Church,
two miles distant. Rev. Mr. Vroum is very
much beloved by bis parishioners and is doing
a good work. The Rectory is a fine building,
standing well back. and surrounded by beauti-
ful grounds, indeed it can be called a mode]
country rectory. The Church is old but kept
in good repair, the Sanctuary receiving special
care; the altar boing adorned with the choicest
tIowers.

DIOCESE 0F MONTREAL.

AYLwIN.-Although the Mission bearing this
name is but our portion of the whole district
formierly se known under the hardworking
care of the Rev. W. P. Chambers, it las two
Churches, besides two out-stations, the one at
Kazubuzua, and i he cthor across the Gatineau
]River, in the towhship of IHincks.

Ono of those Churches, St. James', Wright,
was visited by the Lord Bishop on Saturday,
September lst, where a large congregation
gathored for Divine service at 10.30 o'clook.

Eleven candidates were presented by the new
Incumbent, the Rev. L. B. Pearse, for the lay-
ing on of hands, and who together, with many
others, partook of Holy Communion.

This was until recently the most northerly
Church on the river (and probably in the dio-
cese), but just about this time a new mission
bouse and ohapel at the Desert, some thirty
miles further north, demanded the presence of
our chief astor, and Ris Lordships' visit to
Aylwin C=urch proper was on bis downward
journey from the Desert.

Here too (at St. John's Church, Aylwin), a
large congregation assemblod. Both the Sacra-
mente of the Church were administered, a
well as the Apostolie rite of Confirmation, an
infant being baptized-five candidates renewing
their baptismal vows-and a goodly number
receiving the Lord' Supper.

It is evident from the attendance at both
Churches that the annual coming of our chief
Pastor, isof much interest te many, who, though
not in open communion with the Church of
England, profess and call themoselvea disciples
of the Lord Jesus.

LAoHINE.-The Harvest festival was held in
St. Stephen's Cburch, on Sunday, the 9th of
September. The sacred edifice had been pre.
viously decorated by the ladies of the congre-
gation with flowers, grain, fruit and vegetables,
and presented a very beautiful appearance
being well done and not over done. The lamp
stands were trimmed with wheat, barley, and
oats, relieved with red berries. The window-
sille, which are wide and well adapted te the
purpose, were tastefully arrayed with the prin-
cipal fruits of the earth, the chancel screen
being one mass of fowers, as alse the font.

The Holy Table vested in festal white lad
over it four vases of choice flowers and a basket
of fruit aud sheaf of grain. The re-table bore
the appropriate text "Be ye Thankfil."

The morning service was choral, the Psalms
being well chanted. The Church was well
filled, and the rector, Rev. H. J. Winterbourne,
preached an appropriate sermon from. the text
"While the earth remaineth seed-time and har-
vest, and cold and heat, and winter and sum-
mer, and day and night, shall net cease." A
large number remained for the Holy Commun-
ion, and the offortories were nearly double of
lat year. The afternoon service and the late
service at St. Paul's Church were also encour-
aging and well appreciated by attentive con-
gregations. Laus Deo.

ALLEnN-The Bishop made hie annual
visitation of this Mission on August 30 and 31.
On Augnst 30, Holy Trinity Church, Alleyne,
was weli flled te recei vo His Lordship who was
accompanied by Rev. S. A. Mille. Thora was
a very hearty and congregational service fol-
lowed by a celebration of Holy Communion, at
which 45 persons communicated. Thon on
Friday, August 31, Hie Lordship was driven
out te St. Peter's Chirch, Cawood, where thera
was a hearty service and 17 persona communi-
cated. The offertory on both occasions was
given te the Mission fund.

Sunday, September 9, HolyTiinity, Alleyne,
was filled te overflowing on the occasion of a
Children's service whon the Sunday-school
children of the Mission underwent a general,
catechizing and exhortation by the Rev. II.
Plaisted, M.A., whose earnest practical words;
were listened to by a reverent and attentive
congregation. The offertory taken up was on
Lebalf of the Sunday-school work.

CBELsEA.-The Bishop of the Diocese made
bis annual visit te Chelsea on Thursday and
Friday, the 6th and 7th of Septomber. A
Desnery meeting was held in connection with
His Lordship's visit.

On Thursday evening a Harvest Thanksgiv-
ing service was hold, when effective addresses
were delivered by His Lordship, and the Revs.

SEPTUMBER 19, 1888,

T. :. Cunningham, M.A., T. R Smith, and N.
A. P. Bourne, BA. The Church was very
prettily decorated with an abundance of choice
flowerP, fruit, vegetables, and grain. land the
musec was suitable and hearty. The offertory
was $10.69, which is to aid in paying off the
remaining indebtedness upon the new Parson-
age, about $300. On Friday morning a Confir-
mation service was held, when seven candidates
were presented. Holy Communion was cele-
brated, the clergy, confirmees, and a nuinber of
the communicants, partaking.

The Incumbent of the parish had the pieas-
ure of entertaining the Bishop and clergy at
luncheon on Thursday in the new parsonage,
and on Friday the members of the Deanery en-
joyed the bountiful hospitalities of Mr. and
Mrs. Alonzo Wright, at their charming rosi-
dance.

N.B.-As many of the citizens of Montreal
have cheerfully assisted in building the new
Parsonage at Chelsea, the incumbent, being
now comfortably housed in his new and com-
modious quarters, will be glad Io see thero any
of the contributors and to show thom round
the building. The bouse is to be veneered
with brick laid in black mortar, and to have
a verandah around the west and south sides, in
the Spring. It nestles amongst the trees on
the hillside near the Church, and from its doors
and windows can be had the finest view in the
the neighbourhood, inclUding tho Parlianent
and several other buildings in the Capital ; and
in the evening, nearly all of the electric lights
eau be seau. The Incumbent will be very
gratefil for any further assistance ho may re-
ceive towards completing bis undertaking.

RIvza DEsEaT.-The welcome visit of Our
chief Pastor ta this northerly Mission of his
Diocese was on Sunday, September 2. We are
thankful that we were- able to have him on
that day-the day "when the most number of
people were together."

Morning service at Northfield the most
southerly station of this UiJpper Gatineau mis-
sion, 10 miles above the Pickanock (Mission of
Aylwin), and about 75 north of Ottawa. lere
there was a goodly gathering for the service
which consisted of a shortened morning Prayer,
Confirmation, and Holy Communion. Two of
Christ's children paid their vows untD the
Lord, drew near for the first time te Hie table.

A drive of twenty miles in the afternoon
brought the Bishop, his chaplain (Rev. S. A.
Mills), and Rev. HL. Plaisted, to the Dasert, a
place of increasing importance, and likely te
increase yet more with the railway that is now
confidently expected.

Here at 7 p.m., a good congregation assem-
bled in the Chapel of the Mission house for the
Evening prayer and Confirmation service. In
both Northfield and Desert, the offertory (for
the Mission fund) was very gratifyimig.

The iHoly Communion was celebrated at Da-.
sert at 7 next morning, when la the swcet
morning hour a few (as we trust) carnest souls,
met te be fed with food Divine. The service
over the Bishop and his chaplain again took
their journey southward down the Gatineau te
the Mission of Aylwin and Wakefield.

Hearty thanks are due te Mr. and Mra.
Wright, and Mr. and Mrs. Hastey, at Nort-
field, and te Mr. and Mrs Smith, at Desert, for
their.kindness and hospitality.

The Mission louse above mentioned is the
firet building belonging to the English Church
in this district. It is a small log house with a
little service Room or chapel attached. The
latter had only been tsed once before the
Bishop's coming and the house is net yet com-
pleted, although it is almost in a state in which
it can be used, and the clergyman and his
family who hitherto have been boarding hope
in a short time ta be under their own roof.

The menus to complete, and also te build a
smalil stable, are much needed. The mission-
ary, IRev. H, Plaisted, earnestly hopes that any
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