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Food Prices
and Control.

i7^;i

Yesterday the local flour 
market was marked by 
another advance, so that 
flour now stands at the

expediency. The sole act It has per 
formed since the beginaing of the war 
In which it measured up to Its war 
obligations was its delegation of the 
most important of them to the Patri­
otic Association, since when it has 
acted as if nothing more remained 
to be done. Unfortunately the mat­
ters of which we speak cannot be 
entertained by the Association or any 
such body, for they require legislative 
powers. Evep at this late hour there 
are two things which the present ad­
ministration could perform with 
credit in the course of the last par- 

1 liiamentary session which they will 
control, and which, so far as lies in 
our power, we intend to see perform­
ed. They are the enactment of a War 
Profits Act and the appointment of a 
commission of inquiry of some sort 
into the question of food supplies. 
The one will return to the country 
some of the money that has been ex­
torted from it; the other may have 
the effect of letting the country see 
that It is living in a fools' paradise. 
While all of the sources from which 
we draw tour-fifths of the food we 
live on are greatly concerned by, not 
possible, but evident shortages in the 
near future, we continue to live com­
placently the same hand to mouth ex­
istence as if the causes that operate 
elsewhere cannot possibly have any 
effect upon Newfoundland. If we do 
not some day reap the fruits of our 
improvidence we shall not have our­
selves to thank for it.

A Hazardous
Undertaking.

The mail couriers who convey the 
mails from Gambo to Fair Island, 
B.B., and from Deer Lake to Bonne

unheard of price of $12.70 a barrel. ! Bay are now performing their duty
Whether or not'the foreign market 
has been similarly affected we have 
not informed ourselves, but we know 
that that will be given as the excuse. 
We have not dealt with this and 
similar matters lately, because we 
know that only one side of the ques­
tion is usually represented and that 
not always fairly. But it is plain that 
something must be done" without de­
lay to sift the whole matter of our 
food supply - and distribution to the 
bottom. If the result is simply to vin- 
didate our dealers and prove them in­
nocent of any unfairness and power­
less under influences that they can­
not control, there will be no harm 
but much good done, but we doubt if 
a thorough investigation would reveal 
quite such a state of things. With 
regard to flour, the reason generally 
assigned for sudden advances is that 
the price has gone up in the States 
and Canada, that the market is an 
open one and that flour cannot be 
purchased anywhere at a less price. 
This is very well, but it does not ex­
plain away the fact that the flour 
could have been sold here at a less 
price—in many cases considerably 
less—and still leave a fair profit to 
the sellers. What is not enough re­
cognised here is the fact that this very 
practice of buying and hoarding sup­
plies is one of the causes that con­
tribute everywhere to the high prices 
ruling. It is one, for instance, which 
accounts largely for the prohibitive 
price of potatoes in Canada, where it 
is known that unscrupulous specula­
tors, knowing that there would be a 
shortage, -bought up as much of the 
available stocks as they could lay 
hands on. r

But the question of prices does not 
apply to flour alone; in fact it applies 
less to that commodity than to many 
others. We are to-day in Newfound­
land paying prices for all sorts of 
supplies, foodstuffs and other things, 
which are not accounted for, on com­
parison with the prices at the places 
of supply, by the freights and duties. 
We know well the impracticability, 
almost the impossibility, of attempt­
ing to regulate prices by law, but 
there is nothing to prevent healthy 
investigation. Great profits are be­
ing made .here. They have a simple 
and direct way of dealing with these 
in England. Last year the war.profits 
taxes^ imposed there produced half a 
billion dollars. The difference is, 
that they have a Government there 
which is no respecter of persons but 
a great respecter of. principles; we 
have here a Government, so called, 
which respects nothing but political

under the most trying conditions. 
Tlie numerous rivers and ponds 
which they are compelled to cross are 
now overflowing their banks and in 
most cases where the water is too 
deep to wade through temporary rafts 
have to be constructed. Fortunately 
for the northern people the bay boats 
will soon be taking up their regular 
mail and passenger service.

Central District Court.
Six girls took action against the in­

solvent estate of Mr. J. Rossley for 
wages which they claimed was due 
them. The plaintiffs were members 
of the Rossley Theatrical Troupe, 
which left here last year on a tour of 
the Maritime Provinces where per­
formances were given. The defendant 
entered counter-claims against each 
girl. The hearing of the case occu­
pied the attention of the Court up to 
1 p.m. when an adjournment was 
taken.

McMurdo’s Store News
We shall be glad to buy in dispen­

sing and plain medicine bottles, and 
to give fair prices for the same. Only 
bottles with our own name or quite 
plain bottles will be accepted, and 
patent medicine bottles are not de­
sired. Bottles must be absolutely 
clean, and not chipped round the 
mouth.

Wyeth’s Emulsion of Cod Liver Oil* 
is a preparation of very high class, 
put up by a firm of . chemists well 
known all over the North American 
Continent. And this Emulsion fully 
sustains the reputation of its manu­
facturers. It is very pleasant to take, 
does not upset the stomach or “re­
peat", and is moderate in price. $1.00 
for 16 ounce bottle.

Serious Assault.
WOMAN SERVANT THREW A SET- 

TLE OF BOILING WATER OVER 
HER MISTRESS.
Elizabeth Abbott, >a single woman 

of about forty years of age, of tyrant- 
like appearance and somewhat resem­
bling a freak, was sentenced to three 
months’ imprisonment yesterday for 
an assault committed by her on Mon­
day last. She had been engaged as 
domestic a£ the residence of Mr, T. A. 
Pippy, Torbay Road, and whatever 
words passed between herself and 
Mrs. Pippy on the day in question, she 
seized a kettle and threw its contents 
of hot water at her mistress. A por­
tion of the boiling liquid went over 
Mrs. Pippy’s body and badly scalded 
her, but the wonder is that she es 
capcd so well. The servant then don 
ned her hat and overcoat and made a 
hurried exit, secreting herself in 
barn on Logy Bay Road. A complaint 
of the assault was lodged with the au 
thorities and a deposition was sworn 
out for the arrest of the perpetrator, 
Yesterday afternoon the policeman who 
was orderly at thq court room, learn­
ed of the hiding place of the accused 
and proceeded there to make the ar 
rest. Moral suasion was resorted to 
in the execution of the warrant, as the 
officer knew it was useless to apply 
violence With the accused, who was 
known to be a woman of powerful 
physique, giant strength and a fierce 
temper. However, she would not con­
descend to walk, so a cab was procur­
ed, in which she was driven to the 
lockup. Here she became a little er­
ratic and shouted for a feed, and not 
getting her demand acceded to re­
marked “if I had known this ye never 
would have got me.” She was then 
arraigned before Mr. Hutchings, K.C, 
J.P., admitted the assault and was 
sent to jail for three months. Before 
being removed to the prison the wo­
man became hysterical and started an 
outburst of foul and profane language 
on all concerned.
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Amount acknowledged.............. $126.70
Staff of the Commercial Cable

Co.......................... . . .. .. 21.15

$147.85

RETURNED HOME.—Mr. and Mrs. 
S. D. Grant, of Trinity, who had been 
visiting the city for the past four 
weeks, returned home by yesterday’s 
train. Mrs. Grant spent h few days 
at the General Hospital while here 
and was successfully treated for her 
illness, as her many friends will be 
glad to hear.

FORD Is the car- of no regrets, as it gives perfect eatlsfac- 
* tlon under all conditions.

The FORD cost of upkeep as compared with other cars is 
very much lower.

The FORD is sold completely equipped and ready for the 
road at

.. .. .* .. .. .. . • ., « - .. .. .. • « Towing
•............ 1

Returning Soldiers.
His Excellency the Governor has 

received a cablegram from Major 
Timewell, Record Office, to the effect 
that the following men are proceed­
ing to Newfoundland: 1

909—R.S.M. H. R. H. Peckham, 
Bond Street.

748—Sergt. Joseph McKinley, 
Cook Street.

467—Corporal George Butler, 
Pennywell Road.

1543—Corporal Harold Jackson, SL 
John’s.

474—Corporal John J. Dooley, 23% 
Maxse Street.

153—L.-Corporal Larry Feild, 
Deady’s Lane.

1912—Private Ernest A. Snow, Cri­
quet.

440—Private Frederick G. Roberts, 
Change Islands.

1262—Private Stephen Wiseman, 
Fortune Hr., N.D.B.

1954—Private Walter Caines, Port 
Saunders.

2069—Private Matthew Murphy, 
Simms Street.

628—Private John W. Maddock, Wa­
ter Street.

1003—Private William H. Clark, 
King’s Bridge Road.
. 1098—Private Ernest J. Nosewor­

thy, 17a Parade Street.
1123—Private Herbert E. Baird 

Mount Scio Road.
1125—Private John R. Merchant, 

18 Casey Street.
1474—Private Nicholas Delaney, 

Grand Falls.
1500—Private William Mitchell, 47 

Spencer Street.
1933 —Private Stephen A. Clarke, 

Maryslown, South.
2151—Private Joseph French, Win- 

terton, T.B.
2646—Private James H. Skinner, 

Richard’s Hr., Burgeo.
2710—Private Ernest Fowler, Top­

sail.
2995—Private Abia A. Purchase, 

Grand Bank.
1664—Private William H. Watkins, 

Botwood. /
2031—Private Manuel Oldford, 

Grand Falls.
Department of the Colonial Secre­

tary, April 13th, 1917.

"The First Night.”
It the obvious enjoyment of a very 

large audience is the true test, last
night’s bill of fare at the Casino The
atre was a most successful one. 
opened with a curtain-raiser, VMrs. 
Willis’ Will,” presented by a juvenile 
caste in a manner which would have 
done credit to much older performers. 
The parts were taken by Misses Ter 
esa Smythe, Edith Cleary, Maria Hut­
ton, Alice Harris and Angela Me 
Grath. While the whole piece, which 
was most amusing, was well done, 
with a marked absence of the "reci­
tation” habit which usually belongs 
to young actors, special mention must 
be made of Miss McGrath, who acted 
with the self-possession and detach­
ment of an old hand, and a talented 
one at that. A short concert interval 
followed, consisting of songs by Miss 
es Ryan and Brown, Mrs. Cahill and 
Mr. Ruggles, pleasingly given and 
heartily encore^ “The First Night' 
was then presented and the audience’! 
part in it was a roar of laughter from 
beginning to end. It is really a slight 
farce, almost a burlesque, and as it 
was given last night was a personal 
triumph for Mr. Hutton. Even if the 
author had not done so for him, he 
made the play hie own. In the lead 
ing character of a voluble, fiery, in 
digent old French actor, who schemes 
successfully to make his daughter a 
prima donna, he kept the audience 
continually amused. His active ges­
ticulations and movement, his French 
and broken English, his foreign dig­
nity, which would have been pathetic 
in a more serious play, his artful 
“tickling” of everyone necessary to 
his ends, and a dozen comic manner­
isms went to the making of a part 
which was played to the life. Miss 
Emilie Mare ably supported him as 
his daughter Rose and by contrast 
provided much of the amusement of 
the piece. Miss Doyle played in her 
usual attractive manner as the sup 
planted leading lady. The minor male 
roles were well taken by Messrs. F. 
Knight, who was obviously at home 
in his part, A Reid, looking, however, 
not so much like a playwright as a 
Russian anarchist, W. Warren and L, 
E. Emerson, who acted with vigor and 
smoked real cigars. The piece was 
light, lively and clever, and was great­
ly enjoyed by the audience. Under the 
leadership of Mr. A. Bulley, and as­
sisted by Messrs. F. Emerson and F, 
Bradshaw, the C, C. C. Band made $ 
capable orchestra. A pleasing fea 
ture marked the opening of tfie per­
formance, when at the entry of the 
American Consul the flag of the great 
Republic was raised ahd the band 
played “The Star-spangled Banner,' 
the audience standing and cheering 
enthusiastically.

Obituary.
At Southern Arm, New Bay, on the 

27th of March, death claimed for its 
victim a very promising and high in^- 
portant person to the community, 
Bartlett, the eldest son of Mark Britt, 
formerly of Twill ingate, and whose 
name is well known all over Twillin- 
gate district. The deceased had been 
in perfect health .until two days be­
fore his demise and death came as an 
awful and sudden blow to relatives 
and friends alike, and of the latter he 
had many. He had been with his 
father for about twenty years engag­
ed in the farming industry, and the 
success to which they had attained 
was largely due to Bartlett’s sterling 
qualities, as he was indeed a perse­
vering and energetic young man. His 
loss to the place cannot be repaired 
as he was the real life of it. He 
leaves to mourn a loving father, mo­
ther, wife, two children, sister and 
brother and a very large circle of 
sorrowing friends.

Train Notes.
The incoming express is due here at 

3.15 p.m. to-day.
Yesterday's outgoing express left 

Bishop’s Falls at 8.10 *a.m. to-day.
The local from Carbonear reached 

the city at 1 p.m. to-day.

ISLANDS SUBMERGED,—Cabmen 
who reached the city this morning 
from Portugal Cove say that the wa­
ter in Round Pond at the head of 
Windsor Lake has risen so high from 
the recent rain that several small is­
lands have been completely sub­
merged. The water in Windsor Lake 
has risen to a point unheard of in the 
past twenty-five years.

Stafford’s Liniment car*

Supreme Court.
(Before Mr. Justice Kent.)" 

Daniel Williams vs. Smith Cq„ Ltd. 
■This is an action to recover the sum 

of $438 damages for breach of Charter 
Party dated on the 15th day of May, 
1912, between the plaintiff and de­
fendant of the ship Sidney Smith. 
Charles D. Mayne and Peter Young 
were sworn and gave evidence. Mr. 
W. R. Warren, K.C., for plaintiff ; Mr.

A. W. W. McNeily for defendant. 
Court rose at 1 p.m. ">

Here and There.
ON SPECIAL BUSINESS.—Hon. J.
Robinson left by yesterday’s ere­

press on postal business across coun­
try.

In time of need
Every woman should know the comfort, and experi­
ence the relief of a reliable remedy that can be de­
pended upon to right conditions which cause head­
ache, dizziness, languor, nausea and constipation. At 
such times, nothing is so safe, so sure and speedyay as

FIMt!
During the past sixty years, millions of women have found them 
most helpful in toning and strengthening the system, and for regu­
lating the stomach, liver and bowels. These famous pills are entirely 
vegetable and contain no harmful or habit-forming drugs. Use them 
with entire confidence for they cause no unpleasant after-effects, and

will not fail you
Worth a Guinea a Box

Prepared only by TbomàseBeecham. St. Helens, Lancashire,_Eng!an<L 
Sold everywne;here in Canada and U. S. America. In boxes, 25 cents.

The City Fathers
Hold Heated Discussion Over Steer 

Building—Premier’s Cold Reply to 
Home Rule Resolutions.
Last night’s weekly meeting of the 

Municipal Board was marked by an 
animated discussion on the Steer 
building, resulting in no progress be­
ing made; and a cold reply from the 
Premier concerning the Home Rule 
Resolutions passed by the Board at 
the Previous meeting.

In the absence of the Mayor, Deputy 
Mayor Morris presided, all the other 
Councillors being present.

Supt. Grimes called attention to the 
condition of the western end of Le- 
Marchant Road, the Fire Brigades 
having experienced difficulty in pass­
ing there lately. No steps can be tak­
en at present

The Postmaster General wrote 
about the removal of telegraph poles. 
Deferred for inquiry.

George Best complained of arrears 
charged up to him for 15 years on a 
building, which he said was not lia­
ble for taxes. He submitted a com­
promise of $25, which is being con­
sidered.

Sir E. P. Morris, wired from Lon­
don as follows, re Home Rule Resolu­
tion: “I beg to acknowledge receipt 
of your cable.” "Short and sweet,” 
said the Chairman, “go on with the 
next business.”

Wm. Thompson complained of the 
road near his farm “Cherry Hill.” 
Will be attended to.

Dr. Rendell complained of floods 
during rain storms at rear of resi­
dence, caused by drain and sewer 
there being choked. He was willing 
to pay any reasonable amount named 
by the Board to have the matter re­
medied. Referred to Engineer to es­
timate what the cost would be.

F. Houlihan asked to fence his land 
on Leslie Street. Referred to Engin­
eer, as was also J. F. Marshall’s ap­
plication requesting permission to 
tnake repairs to his house on Cabot 
Street.

A. Slmmonds applied for permission 
to enlarge stable on Barnes’ Road. 
Referred to Health Inspector.

Permission was granted J. B. Uuqu- 
hart to erect shed at the waterfront 
to be used for storing of two ton au^ 
tomobile truck.

The Solicitor reported on Mr. Reg. 
Dowden’a claim. He exonerated the 
employees of the Water Department 
and stated that the Council are not 
liable in the matter.

The Solicitor also gave his advice.

on invitation, on the vexed question 
of whether or not permission could 
B6 given Steer Bros, to extend office 
space. He reported that under Sec­
tion 7 of the 1911 Act passed by the 
Legislature the Board had neither 
option nor liberty to give permission.

The Deputy Mayor invited discus 
sion on the matter and there and 
then matters became lively.

Councillor Brownrlgg thought it un­
wise to have asked the opinion of the 
Solicitor. Under all the circumstan­
ces, it was a great hardship on Steer 
Bros., who were very much hamper­
ed for office space at the present time 
and who only asked for permission 
temporarily, they having already 
guaranteed to erect a new building as 
soon as arrangements were finalized 
with the absentée landlords. Contin­
uing, he thought the applicants should 
be given ample time to carry out their 
plans and to rc.use permission, would 
not only mean inconvenience to Steer 
Bros., but be cruel to their employ­
ees (young women and young men) 
who are now working under difflcul 
ties. He then made a resolution 
in order, that the Board override the 
Solicitor’s report.

The Chairman sympathized with the 
applicants, but he believed nothing 

! further could be done In the matter,
Councillor Vinnicombe endorsed the 

views of Councillor Brownrlgg, point­
ing out that he had personally ob­
served how the office employees 

. Steer Bros, were huddled together.
I He had much pleasure in supporting 
Councillor Brownrigg’s motion, 

j he did not see why this Council had 
' not the right to override the opinion 
of the Solicitor as well as previous 

J Boards.
Councillor Mullaly here “kicked 

over the traces” and said he was sur 
prised that the Chairman had invited 
discussion in face of the Solicitor' 
report.

The Deputy Mayor retorted, “don’t 
be surprised, every individual Coun­
cillor has a perfect right to speak. 
He then put Councillor Brownrigg’s 
motion that Steer Bros, be allowed to 
raise their bulding four feet.

Councillor Mullaly again jumped in 
to the ring and protested vigorously 
against the Chairman entertaining 
such a proposition, as it was against 
the express advice of the Solicitor, 
who was being paid by the city for 
his opinion.

Councillor Vinnicombe again dis­
agreed with Conn. Mullaly and 
thought It outrageous to refuse the 
applicants permission, all things con­
sidered.

Councillor Ayre did not agree with 
the last speaker. He was sorry for 
the applicants for "obvious reasons, 
but did not see why the Solicitor’s 
advice should be thrown aside and 
the law defied. He added that the 
statement “the Council was left with­
out the option or liberty to gtaint per­
mission” simply meant that we are 
up against a stone wall.

On motion of Councillor Mullaly 
the matter was deferred until the 
Mayor is présent.

Councillor Tait gave notice that 
next week he would introduce discus­
sion on the hopper question.

J. J. Lacey asked permission to 
extend kitchen off Pleasant Street. 
Referred to Engineer.

Engineer Holden reported that it 
was possible to get a crop of oats 
from Harvey’s Field. He will be ask­
ed to submit cost of planting.

The meeting was then- closed.

And the Worst is Yet to Come
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Mr. Alfred H. Allen, who is 
returning to England in July, 
desires meanwhile to dispose 
of the remainder of his pic­
tures, books, music, etc., which 

i be seen by appointment, 
82 Freshwater Road.—aprl2,3i

TO ENLARGE OFFICE BUILDING 
—A number of carpenters are n6w 
busy preparing for the building of an 
additional story to the offices of the

mipp
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To Enter Hospital.
Mrs. Driscoll, from New Melbourne, 

T. B., reached the city by last night’s 
train to enter the hospital for medical 
treatment.

Miss Prowse, of Allandale Road; 
City, for an operation for appen-’ 
dicitis was conveyed to the hospital 
yesterday in the ambulance.

Mr. Richard Gosse, of Blaketown, 
via Whltbourne, reached the city to­
day to enter the hospital.

Mr. Geo. Barrett who was taken 
sick since his return from the ice­
fields was removed to the hospital 
yesterday.

Mr. Lidstone, of Salmon Cove, C. B., 
also entered the institution yesterday.

Eat Big Meals! No 
Sour, Acid Stomach, 

Indigestion or Gas
“Pape’s Dlapepsln” Is quickest, 

surest stomach relief 
known—Try it!

Time It! Pape’s Dlapepsln will di­
gest anything you eat and overcome 
a sour, gassy or out-of-order stom­
ach surely within five minutes.

If your meals don’t fit comfortably, 
or what you eat lies like a lump of 
lead In your stomach, or If you have 
heartburn, that Is a sign of indiges­
tion.

Get from your pharmacist a flfty- 
cent case of Pape’s Dlapepsln and take 
a dose just as soon as you can. There 
will be no sour risings, no belching 
of undigested food mixed with acid, 
no stomach gas or heartburn, full­
ness or heavy feeling In the stom­
ach, debilitating headaches, dizziness 
or intestinal griping. This will all 
go, and, besides, there will be no sour 
food left over In the stomach to poison 
your breath with nauseous odors.

Pape’s Dlapepsln Is a certain cure 
for out-of-order stomachs, because it 
takes hold M your food and digests 
it just the same as if your stomach 
wasn’t there. *

Relief in five minutes from all 
stomach misery Is waiting for you at 
any drug store.

These large flfty-cent cases con­
tain enough “Pape’s Dlapepsln" to 
keep the entire family free from 
stomach disorders and Indigestion for 
many months. It belongs In your 
home.

Here and There.
Fresh Smelts and Fresh Her­

ring at ELLIS’.

HIS EXCELLENCY WILL ATTEND 
—We understand His Excellency the 
Governor and Lady Davidson will at­
tend “The First Night” at the Casino 
to-night.

Received a shipment of Scotch 
Coopers’ Tools. B O W RIN G 
BROS., Ltd., Hardware Dept.

CITIZENS’ COMMITTEE. — The 
Citizens’ Committee will meet in the 
Board of Trade Rooms at 8 o’clock 
to-night for the further discussion of 
the Charter.

Fairbanks Brass Globe and 
Angle Valves to be had at BOW­
RING BROS., Ltd, -Hardware 
Dept.—£eb6.tf

PATRIOTIC ASSOCIATION—There 
will be a meeting of Patriotic Asso- 
sodatlon at the Board of Trade 
Rooms, at 8 o’clock on Monday night 
to discuss the formation of the For­
estry Battalion.

Just arrived, some FRESH 
POULTRY—Geese, Ducks and 
Chickén, for sale at lowest 
market prices. P. CASEY, 
Water Street.—apr2,tf

SUFFERING FROM LAGRIPPE. — 
Mr. Malcolm Parsons, of the Nfld. 
Boot and Shoe Mfg. Co., who contract- 

lagrippe while traveling for his 
firm, has been confined to his home 
since last Saturday.

STOMACH. 
Stafford’s
etiwlB_.1
sia. Price 25 
Postage 5 and

TROUBLES. — 
“A”

1 the late John Harvey Spry will 
id to rest this afternoon at the C 
■al Protestant Cemetery. The 

Fellows, of
" JP
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