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.../,, 1. The iiae of Wlne by Biblioal phftraoliers. <,h ^.it

If tt is siill persist«d tbat wine of an intoiicating nature viras ujed by tome bf tha

imost prominent characters of the Bible, we h«v« only to glance at its eflfects to &«« the

.absu.rûity of ; Jcing such a course an cxample to Imb followed. It will be noiioed tî'jtt

its effects ^vere only evil wlienever any effects were reoordcdi

Noah'B Drunkemless-
Gen. ix. 20, 21-^" And Noah began tobe an husbandmani and he planted a vine<

yard; and he drank of the wine andVas drunken ; and he was nncovered within his

^ttbt." Thi» is the very fi^'st mention that is made of wine in the bible, and its effectt

upon Noah shows that it was intoxicating. It dethroned his mental powers to anch gn
extent that he lost ail sensé of propriety, and fell into a state of indécent exposure in

his tent during his insensibility. This unfortunate occurrence aiso beoa^e the occasion

of national misfortuwe to one Une of his descendants, through the disrospect of bne of

"his sons. There. is no doubt t^ut the first effects of the wine wis ejchilarating, calling

out the vital nervous énergies to expel it, he was deceived into the belief that it aiTorq»

«d some spécial advantage which ordinary food did not afibrd ; but, that it also " blun-

ted " the finer sensibilities of bip nature, which should always be acute and activé, is

also quite apparent. In this i^tance there is certainly nothing to recommend the use
ofintoxicaùngwine.

Ja,,-'.,;,;. Mv»
Lot's Shame.

This is the next undisputed mention of wine, which is in Gen. xix. 34, 36—«'In thi»

instance the wine was doubtless of the kind callrd " mixed winè," which possessed
xnost powerfully intoxicating propettiies. The effects here.doqi not recommend the use
of intoxicating wine. ni.,j, ;j,i,-,j ..^^.ii^o.. ..„.. .,,.„ri ,i,,;..,v, r. .„i.,>,r.u

jj^^j
Nadab and Ablhue.

Xaron's two son&, while under the influence of intoxicating drink. disobeyed the
"express command of the Almighty by offering strange fire upon the altar. In consé-
quence of this daring act of disobedience they were sùddenly smitten with deatb by the
hand of tue Lord, who evidently designed by this summary act of justice to render
them an example to succeeding générations. This is a most striking illustration of the
influence of Alrohol to dcbase the spiritual feelings, and, also, of God'» displeasure

-towards those who are entrusted with spiritual duties, and who place thentselves under
its baneful influence. Physiological facts inevltably point to the conclusion that its

indulgence to ;3iny e.'itent whatever disturbs thé superior portion of the brain, which is

devoted to a récognition of inôral and spiritual interests, bv exciting the base, which is

that portion that relates us to a physîcal existence, and the passional influences. - It

certainly will not be argued in any of thèse cases that , the use of " intoxicating'' winè
was beneflcial?

The Totcd Abstainers of the Bible.

Let us now inquire into the dea'<.ngs of God with those who discarded the use of
wine. While there is no évidence in the Bible that the use of "intoxicating" wine
ever did, or ever could, do any one the slightest possible good, we hâve the illustrions

«xample of some of the most eminent biblical characters^ total abstainers.

The Israelilea r

During the sojoum of tbe childrenof Israël in E^pt, they were undoubtedly total

abstainers, since their masters, the Egyptiant, at that timemade no use ofanyfermented
liquors. And during their sojoum in the wilderness they were of necessity abstainers,

their only drink being the purest waterfromthe '*rock." To this long discipline of
tempérance might be largely attributed that hardihood and fortitude coupled with
bravery, which enabled them to sweep out with astonishing rapidity the enervated
nations of Palestine, who had wasted their énergies by intempérance and riotous livio|^!

and were thus easily vanquished, though protected by strong walls aod fortresses.. .:?<>

The Nazaritôs. ,';

At the time of the establishment of the cérémonial law, there was also establÎ!

:an Association of total abstainers* which were called Nazarites. They dedicated
"thentselves wliolly to the service of God ; an^. Qneof the conditions of ^ecUcatiop yii^

the total abstinance from the use of wine. To insure a per'fect observance of the p^^ge
;ajl wipe wasprohibitcdwhether fermented ,or not, Manvofthe £nest personages of

the Bible were mernbérs of this class or or^^r. And, it.is most probable that Daniel
aod his thfM Hebrew brethren were Nazarites, as. ^ey r^f^8ed to ^nttki.t^e Kuiig's

wine, preferring puise and water.
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