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North/South Dialogue—its time has come
populations. Secondly, the 
post-war Bretton Wood period 
had lead to rapid economic 
growth in the industrialized 
countries while for the rest of 
the international system this 
growth was minimal and in 
some cases negative. From 
this, the Third World became a 
part of the international sys­
tem that was characterized by 
increased inequalities. To­
wards the end of the seventies 
it was felt that it was time to 
do something about changing 
some of the structures that 
lead to those inequalities.

by Patrick J. McManus bate. Since that time, a num­
ber of Third Worid leaders 
have been important actors at 
various times. Algeria in par­
ticular was very influential in 
setting up the diplomatic 
agenda. In many ways, the de­
bate peaked towards the end 
of the 1970’s with the Con­
ference on International Eco­
nomic Co-operation held in 
Paris and with the special UN 
General Assembly that took 
place last fall in New York.

On the North side it would 
seem to me the major leaders 
have been the smaller First 
World countries. Primarily, 
countries like Sweden and 
Holland have been very much 
in the forefront. Trudeau has 
been a continuing figure in the 
middle of the debate. Canada 
did Co-chair the Paris Dia­
logue last year.

Shaw: That rather parochial 
perception is misplaced be­
cause many of the problems 
the world faces can no longer 
be dealt with merely on a na­
tional level. The problems of 
energy, population, food, and 
scarce resources, concern 
everyone. It’s misleading of 
the leaders of the North to 
give the impression that they 
can turn around their own 
economies without taking into 
account the impact such a 
move would have on the rest 
of the world. This is one rea­
son why the North/South dia­
logue may be due for a revival. 
Leaders such as Trudeau real­
ize that to come to grips with 
northern problems of reces­
sion and inflation require 
similar measures to be taken 
in the south.

Shaw: Part of the North/South 
debate feels that there is a 
lack of economic manage­
ment in the international 
system and this had lead to 
unfortunate results for the 
Third and Fourth Worlds. Due 
to terms of trade that move 
against them, Thi&d World 
countries suffer from fluc­
tuating exchange rates. These 
countries feel unable to effec­
tively plan their own econo­
mies because it is not clear 
what is going to happen in the 
international economy.

How this restructuring 
should occur is, of course, a 
rather difficult and controver­
sial question. Clearly it would 
be possible to set up more in­
tegrated programs for com­
modities to bring about a 
degree of order and stability in 
the cocoa, coffee, tin, and rub­
ber markets to name a few.

I think that in general the 
Third World wants to go con­
siderably beyond the piece­
meal attempts and create an 
international economic order 
in which the world resources 
are effectively redistributed 
and the benefits flow to, 
rather than away from them.

In his recent international 
tour, Prime Minister Trudeau 
expressed interest in the revi­
talization of the North/South 
dialogue. If successful, this 
would insure equal economic 
growth for the Third World 
under a new Global Economic 
Order. Dalhousie Political 
Science Professor, Timothy 
Shaw, is an expert on African 
International relations and has 
worked for several years in 
Africa. Shaw believes that the 
North/South dialogue’s time 
has come.

O: How did the dialogue de­
velop and who were some of 
its major participators?Q: How did the North/South 

dialogue originate?

Shaw: In the early 1960’s, the 
United Nations set up the UN 
Conference on Trade and De­
velopment. Major issues such 
as international aid and tech­
nology were debated. As this 
conference progressed, many 
Third World countries felt that 
it was time for a special 
United Nations General As­
sembly to deal with the Inter­
national Economic Order de-

Shaw: It originated out of two 
related concerns. Firstly, the 
Third World had become inde­
pendent largely at the begin­
ning of the 1960's. By the be­
ginning of the 70’s, it was 
recognized that independence 
had its limitations. The Third 
World was seeking to improve 
the meaning and benefits of 
independence for their own

Q: We in the North are facing a 
dangerous economic crisis. 
With high inflation, unemploy­
ment, and interest rates, the 
dim prospect of recession 
constantly looms over us. 
Should not we be concerned 
with putting our own house in 
order?

Q: Prime Minister Trudeau's 
plan is to bring about a set of 
structural reforms giving more 
power to poor countries in two 
main international bodies— 
the World Bank and the Inter­
national Monetary Fund. How 
would this be beneficial?

Q: There appears to be great 
disunity amongst the Third 
World countries. The Group of 
77, an organization of im­
poverished nations, is divided 
on the North/South dialogue. 
The OPEC states still have to 
take a stand.
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Champion’s complaint 
that the Student Council had 
not received1 ttte constitutions 
of all the mdivrdyaf frater­
nities.

submitted a list of officers and 
their constitution, thereby 
meeting the requirements of a 
B society.

Jeff Champion, vice-presi­
dent of the Student Council, 
says that a B society rmJSV 
submit “an acceptable con­
stitution". Champion says the 
IFC was never officially recog­
nized as a B society, “They 
were given the privileges of a 
B society on the understaod- 
ing that they would comply

January ttdf from the Stu­
dent Council, d« the advice of 
the Grants Committee. Kelly 
says they were told to reapply 

-for the remainder in the 
second term. A letter of 
January 22nd from the Stu­
dent Council to the IFC said 
that if all member fraternities 
of the IFC didn’t submit 
acceptable constitutions they 
would not be eligible for 
grants from the Student 
Union.

Kelly says, “The IFC 
should have the right to police 
and organize its own activi­
ties, and the Student Council 
agreed that the IFC has the
ability to do $b’r, the problem ‘ average per capita income In 
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by Sheila Fardy
The (IFC) Inter-Fraternity 

Council has been demoted to a 
D society from a B society, 
which means they are no 
longer eligible for subsidies. 
This decision was reached by 
Dalhousie Student Union vice- 
president, Jeff Champion, but 
the rationale behind it differs 
depending on who you talk to.

Randy Kelly, president of 
the IFC, says that the IFC

Shaw: The whole question of 
the degree of unity in the 
Third World is very controver­
sial. The smaller and weaker 
countries only have influence 
and leverage if they are united. 
The Group of 77 have tried 
very hard to hang together 
because they need each other 
in terms of maintaining any 
pressure for change. More­
over, they are more im­
poverished compared to the 
industrialized states. The 
average per capita income in 
Kuwait is clearly different 
from that in Tanzania. The

“He s directly contradicting 
himself,’’ said Kelly, “he 
should have rules or no rules. 
How are we supposed* to tsfTff 
we're a B society or not?"

The IFC applied for a grant 
of about $1500 fn November of 
1960. They received $300 in

A peek at the past
continued from page 8
We next ask where, for the 
great majority of young ladies, 
is this best education possible 
10 be Obtained? We answer 
unhesitatingly in Dalhousie 
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ter a lady to present
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then, young women would 
receive the best education 
possible, and thi* «threation 
qan best fee ofet^ned herself
Dalhousie. it certainly follows a view folàipptH 
that they should be admitted -j" years ewrae. 
within the precincts of our - classes is a gond 
Alma Mater.

3College 
come the great majority of 
young ladies desirous of- 
obtaining higher education 
will be residents of Halifax. 
For most of these it would be 
very inconvenient, perhaps 
impossible, to leave their
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