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Bills (continued.)

24. Oyster Fisheries ; for the regulation of
'the, in this Island. Reported froi Coin-
mittee and read the first time, 51, 52 ;
committed, 59 ; further considered and
reported with amendments, 60 ; motion
to receive report, ib; motion of amend-
ment to defer three months, neg'd. on
division, ib; main motion aff'd. on divi-
sion, 60, 61 ; passed, 69'; by Council with
amendments, 86 ;, amendments read, ib,
agreed to, 117; assent, 144.

25. Flour and Meal ; to regulate. the inspec-
tion of the quality and weight of, through-
out the Island. Reported from Committee
and read first time, 55 ; committed ib;
passed, 59 ; by Council with amendments,
82 ; anendments read first time, ib;
agreed to, 91 ; assent, 144.

26. Church of England, in this Island ; to
amend the Act of 3rd William the 4th,
Chapter 20, respecting the. Reported
from Committee and read first time, 58 ;
referred to Private Bill Committee, ib;
who report, 62 ; considered, 62, 63,
passed, 67 ; by Council, 82 ; assent, 144.

27. Education ; in further amendment of the
Laws relating to, and also to explain and
amend the Act relating to the establish-
ment of the Prince of Wales College.
Reported from Committee and read first
time, 59 ; committed and reported with
amendients, 70; motion to receive
Report, ib; motion of amend ment to defer
three months, neg'd. on division ib; main
motion aff'd. on division, 70, 71 ; passed,
73, 74 ; by Council, 86 ; assent, 144.

28. Partition of Lands ; for facilitating the,
held by persons as Joint Tenants, Copar-
ceners or Tenants in Common. First
reading, 59, 60 ; committed, 61 ; passed,
67 ; by Council with amendments, 91
amendments agreed to, ib; assent, 144.

29. In addition to the Act to require Clergy-
men and others authorized to solemnize
Marriages, to retùrn certificates thereof,
to the Surrogate of the Island, 'and to
require Clergymen to keep a record of
Baptisms. Reported from Committee and
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read first time, 61 ; motion to make
'second reading an order of the day, ib;
motion of amendment to defer three
months, neg'd. on division, ib; main
motion aff'd. ib; read second time and
considered, 68, 71 ; passed, 79; by
Council, 91; assent, 144.

30. Small Debt Courts in this Islatid ; to
autliorize the establishment of certain
additional. Reported from Committee
and read first time, 63 ; second reading,
71 ; motion to consider, ib; 'motion of
amendment to defer three months, neg'd.
on division, ib; main motion aff'd. and
Bill conmitted, ib; motion for third
reading, 73 ; motion of amendment to
defer three months, neg'd. on division ib;
main motion affirnied, Bill read third time
and passed, ib; by Council, 86 ; assent,,
344.

31. Landlord and Tenant; for settling dif"
ferences between, and to enable tenants
on certain Townships to purchase the fee
simple of their farms. First reading, 64 ;
second reading, 74 ; motion to consider,
ib; motion of rmendment to defer three
months, ib; ýdebate thereon and debate
adjourned, ib; debate resumed and ques-
tion on amendment neg'd. on division, 74,
75 ; main motion af 'd on division andE
Bill considered, 75 ; further considered.
77, 78 ; motion to receive report of Com-
mittee, ib; motion of amendment to defer
three months neg'd. on division, ib; main
motion af'd. on division, ib; motion for
third reading, 80 ; motion of amendment
to defer three months, neg'd. on division,,
ib;m iin motion aff'd, on division, 81;
motion that the Bill do pass, ib; motion
of amendment to defer'three months, neg'd.
on division, ib; main motion af'd. on
division, îb; passed by Council, with
amendments, 123 ;,amendments read,, ib;
agreed to, 125 ; assent, 144.

32. Insolvent Debtors ; to hiend the Act
now in force for the' relief of. First
reading, 65 ; committed, 68 ; passed, 73;
by Council, 82; assent, 144.


