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on unstabie, expensive sources of foreign oil, which reliance is
a significant contributor to inflation in the country.

Mr. MacEaehen: Mr. Speaker, 1 arn getting a number of
homilies frorn the Prime Nlinister, but no answers to my
questions. May I ask him one final question? In view of the
fact that the substantiai increases in the budget are intended to
finance the tax credit program for home owners--and that is
obvious-wili the Prime Ninister justify, or expiain to the
country why A the taxpayers in Canada shouid bc caiied upon
to finance a program which is intended to serve and heip oniy
a special group in the community?

Some hon. Members: Hear, hear!

Mr. Clark: Mr. Spcaker, the officiai opposition has earried
its oppo~sition to this program, which wiil benefit thcîusands of
Canadian home owners, into obstructive measures in the
[buse of Commons. They are now carrying that opposition
into the question period. If the member has questions he wants
to direct in relation to the budget, and to use the question
period for the purpose for which it was intended, 1 invite those
questions.

Some hon. Members: Hear, hear!

0 (1420)

EFFECT ON INTEREST RATES

Mr. Ed Lumley <Stormont-Dundas): Mr. Speaker, rny ques-
tion is to the Prime Minister. F or over a year now the Prime
Nlinister lias promised iower interest rates. Can he tell the
flouse wha*t measures there are in the budget that wili have
the generai effect of iowering interest rates throughout
Canada, outside the smaii business deveiopment bonds'?

Some hon. Members: Oh, oh!

Hon. John C. Crosbie (Minister of Finance): Mr. Speaker,
whiie the whoie thrust of the budget-

Some hon. Members: Oh, oh!

Mr. Speaker: Order. Whilc iieckliig has been part of our
practice, 1 cannot understand how it is possible to start to
heekie a person before they have begun to give a response.

Some hon. Members: 1-ear, hear!

Mr. Crosbie: Mr. Speaker, the whoie thrust of the budget is
to ereate an environment in which interest rates can go down.
That wiii bc done by reducing the suze of the governirent
deficit and by reducing the government's financiai require-
ments for next year by $1i.75 billion, whieh wiii give more
room to the private sector and case the pressure on interest
rates. 1 hope that the forecasts in our budget are more
accurate thdn those made iast year, when an infiationi rate of
6.5 per cent was prophesied and it is now 9.2 per cent.

Mr. Lumley: Mr. Speaker, 1 regret that the Prime Minister,
who made the promise during the ciection campaign, couid not

[Mr. Clark.]

answer my question and had to defer it to the Minister of
Finance. I wiii put rny supplementary question to the Prime
Minister. The Prime Ninister lias taikcd about heiping special
groups in our society. Outside of the minimum relief provided
by the energy tax credit, what does the Prime Minister plan to
do for the senior citizens of this country, particuiariy those
living on fixed incomes?

Mr. Crosbie: M4r. Speaker, the senior citizens of this country
wiii be assisted by the energy tax credit, which wiii appiy
particuiariy to those who have an income of up to $21i,380.
They have been assisted by our spouses' aiiowance legisiation,
which was introduced in this House this fali to aceount for a
Liberal gap. Senior citilens wiii aiso be assisted by the new
veterans' aiiosvance legisiation that has been introduced, and
further assisted by the fact that we wiii bring our econorny
back to a heaithy state, which wiil have the effeet of inereasing
the amount that they wiii get from the government generaily.

Some hon. Members: 1-lear, hear!

ALL[GED Rt VERSAL OF ELLCTION CAMPAIGN PROMISES

Mr. Edward Broadbent (Oshawa). Mr. Speaker, biarnex is
blarney whether or not it cornes from Newfoundiand. 1 wouid
iike to ask the Prime Minister a serious question.

During the recent ciection campaign, the Prime Minister
promised to stimuiate the econorny provide iow intcrest rates
and bring forw ard major tax cuts for the people of Canada.
Considering ihat in last nigit's budget the governmnent
reversed itseif compieteix on vir tuaily every one of these
promises by bringing forward a restrictive budget. by main-
taining higli interest rates, and by inereasing taxes by somne
$3.5 billion for the people of Canada, wouid the Prime Minis-
ter expiain to the flouse and Io the people of Canada why, in a
pariiamentary dernocracy, after reversing himseif so compiete-
iy, lie ouglit not go to the Governor Generai to seek dissolution
in order to get a mandate froin the people of Canada for this
compiete reversai of policies?

Some hon. Niembers: [lear, liear!

Right Hon. Joe Clark (Prime Mînister): Mr. Speaker, one
can always tell when the Leader of the New Demnocratie Parts
intends to raise a question that lie does not regard as serious.
because lie pretaces it by caiiing tl a serious question. The
Leader of the New Demiocratic Party shouid know that if lie
wishes to force an cection upon the country, lie wiii have to
take tl on his own shouiders and not seek shortcuts in the way
lie lias suggested and as lie lias done in a number of other
ways.

Some hon. Members: Hlear, hear!

NMr. Broadbent: Mr. Speaker, the Prime Nlinister will sec
from the aniendinents we intend to mnove today--when we will
have ail 27 mnembers present-that vwe intend to be consistent.
at ieast. with what we promised the people of Canada.
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