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right to use, industrial, commercial or scientific equipment, or for information con-
cerning industrial, commercial or scientific experience.

5. The provisions of paragraphs 2 and 3 shall not apply if the recipient of the
royalties, being a resident of a Contracting State, carries on in the other Contracting
State in which the royalties arise a trade or business through a permanent establish-
ment, or performs in that other State professional services from a fixed base, and the
right or property in respect of which the royalties are paid is effectively connected
with such permanent establishment or fixed base. In such a case, the provisions of
Article VII or Article XIV, as the case may be, shall apply.

6. Royalties shall be deemed to arise in a Contracting State when the payer is
that State itself, a political subdivision, a territorial administrative subdivision, a
local authority, or a resident of that State. Where, however, the person paying the
royalties, whether he is a resident of a Contracting State or not, has in a Contracting
State a permanent establishment or fixed base in connection with which the obliga-
tion to pay the royalties was incurred, and those royalties are borne by that perma-
nent establishment or fixed base, then such royalties shall be deemed to arise in the
Contracting State in which the permanent establishment or fixed base is situated.

7. Where, owing to a special relationship between the payer and the recipient or
between both of them and some other person, the amount of the royalties paid, hav-
ing regard to the use, right or information for which they are paid, exceeds the
amount which would have been agreed upon by the payer and the recipient in the
absence of such relationship, the provisions of this Article shall apply only to the
last-mentioned amount. In that case, the excess part of the payments shall remain
taxable according to the law of each Contracting State, due regard being had to the
other provisions of this Convention.

ARTICLE XIII

Gains from the Alienation of Property

1. Gains from the alienation of immovable property may be taxed in the Con-
tracting State in which such property is situated.

2. Gains from the alienation of movable property forming part of the business
property of a permanent establishment which an enterprise of a Contracting State
has in the other Contracting State or of movable property pertaining to a fixed base
available to a resident of a Contracting State in the other Contracting State for the
purpose of performing professional services, including such gains from the alienation
of such a permanent establishment (alone or together with the whole enterprise) or
of such a fixed base may be taxed in the other State. However, gains from the aliena-
tion of ships or aircraft operated in international traffic and movable property per-
taining to the operation of such ships or aircraft, shall be taxable only in the Con-
tracting State in which such property is taxable according to paragraph 3 of Article
XXI.

3. Gains from the alienation of shares or similar rights of the capital stock of a
company the property of which consists principally of immovable property situated
in a Contracting State, may be taxed in that State.


