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* SACERDOTAL WORK *

ON BEHALF OF THE

Juniorate of the Most Blessed Sacrament
TERREBONNE.

The Juniorate of the Most Blessed Sacrament’s aim 
is to help boys who want to become priests in the Order 
of the Most Holy Sacrament. We are anxious, at the 
present moment, to extend this timely help to sixty 
youths thus favored, but left to our own resources, that 
is impossible, on account of the many expenses a college 
entails. So to avoid the painful necessity of refusing 
many promising subjects likely to become holy Priest 
Adorers and Eucharistic Apostles, we appeal to the 
charitable co-operation of our generous Benefactors.
An easy wey to glorify God and draw down His Blessings:

Become a member in the Association of «Sacerdotal 
Work» by having your name inscribed on the register 
and paying a yearly membership fee of 10 cents, and 
share in the benefits noted below.

Blank lists to enrol fifty members will be sent on appli­
cation to those who wish to become Benefactors of the 
Juniorate by undertaking to fill them.

N.-B—On those lists may be inscribed the names of 
parents or friends, living or deceased so that they may 
share in the Masses and various prayers offered for the 
Members.

Thus by the small sum of 10 cents you help a y outh 
who wants to become a priest and participate in many 
spiritual favors.

No one, no matter how poor, but can give this sum and 
have his name registered as associate member, cither


