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Smith & Richardson's

CLYDESDALES
Our Clydesdale Stallions and Mares 

have wintered nicely, and we now have 
a number for sale at reasonable prices, 
amongst them the Toronto Show win­
ner, KARON GARTLEY, ist and 
sweepstakes.

Address : Columbus, Ontario. 
Stations—Oshawa and Brooklin, 

G.T.R.; Myrtle, C.P R.

Shin and Clydesdale Horses, Shorthorn Cattle
Choice Stock on hand at all times. Customer* never disappointed.

J. M. QARDHOU8E, Weiton, Ont.
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way's sale by Messrs. Montgomery's, 
Scut., and exported there with Cedric 
and Prince Sturdy. Another young 
stallion still for sale is Maple Cliff 
Stamp, a smooth bodied colt by The 
Right Stamp (2245), dam Highland 
Maid by Sir Walter (8272) and with 
five registt rt <i dams i" lus tredit. 
Among the marcs is Woodcnd Lily, 
a bright bay with white stripe on face 
and white hind legs, a get of the 
Hiawatha horse l.abori, dam by 
Prince Sturdy, g.d. Darling by Top­
gallant, g.gd Rosie of the Glen, by 
Prince of Renfrew (064) Fanny is 
also a fine promising bay filly, a get 
of Lord Locliinvar, g.d Harming of 
Atichcndolly by King Darnley (2110) 
Bella McGregor is an exceptionally 
well bred filly tracing to Sir William 
Wallace and Prince Imperial. Jenny 
Lind (9158) is a nice bay with ap­
proved quality and conformation 
sired by Home Secretary (5837)1 g.d 
by Nasmyth (3004), g.g.d. by Young 
Campsic 3rd, tracing to Prince of 
Wales 10731 and with a fine colt at 
foot to Qpcil. Among the bacon 
swine the name of Maple Cliff is 
familiar to all. At the present time 
there are a number of young stock 
for sale, bred from their imported 
Tam worth boar Whitcacre Bruce, a 
well known prize winner, first at the 
Royal in England, and second at the 
Pan-American being among his tri 
umphs. Darlicld Grandee, imp., was 
also winner of first at Ottawa, and is 
leaving Ins impress on the young 
stock bred fioui imported sows, just 
the kind of young stock that breeders 
of bacon hogs arc looking for There 
are also a few good Ayrshire cows 
in the large dairy herd on the farm.

The firm of Smith & Richardson, 
the popular and well known firm of 
Clydesdale breeders and importers, 
have a good account to give of their 
season's work in the importing and 
disposing of a large number of fine 
typical Clydesdale stallions and 
mares. An ever increasing trade in 
Canadian-bred stallions and pure-bred 
fillies and mares points the future 
pathway of the business, and should 
be a pointer to farmers still in doubt 
as to what course to pursue in the 
matter of horse breeding. Those who 
breed from good Canadian-bred or 
imported marcs can be assured of a 
ready demand at very remunerative

(rices. At the present time they
ave still in their barns several fine 

imported Clydesdale stallions all well 
fitted and in the pink of condition to 
commence their season's work. Ba­
ron Gartly, now grown to a horse of 
an even ton, is in better bloom than 
when he won the championship at 
Toronto Spring Show, and will stand 
at the stable» at Columbus for service 
during the season. It is not generally 
known that this horse when shown at 
the Glasgow Show was placed fourth. 
Royal Dean, the fine black four-year- 
old, which was so popular at the 
Spring Show is now also in the pink 
of condition and bloom, and promises 
lots of good to the lucky purchaser. 
He is a royal bred fellow, sired as 
he is by the good horse The Dean, 
a get of the great Royal Gartly, by 
Mount Royal. His dam is by Lord 
I-othian, and he, like the famous sire 
of Baron's Pride, Sir Evcrard. was a 
get of Topgallant, by Darnley (222). 
Baron Black the three-year-old Ba­
ron's Pride colt, is a fine drafty black 
with white points, and has wonder 
fully improved since the exhibition, 
and is now looking like one of the 
best in the stables. His dam is by 
Flashwood, a full brother of the great 
McGregor, and a horse who had he 
lived, would have helped him to 
make Clydesdale history Glenlivet

is a nice promising bay with white 
points, got by Moutrave Sentinel, a 
son of the Prince of Albion. He is 
a half brother of Lavender, a horsi- 
popular 111 Ontario county. Royal 
Kcir (10881) is a big drafty aged 
horse, one that has proved to be a 
sire of show horses, his gets having 
won in strong company in Toronto. 
He is a son of Royal Gartly, dam by 
New Hope and g.d. by Prince of 
Wales. Prince Comrade is a bay with 
white points, heavy and of good bod 
ily conformation, lie shows lots of 
the right kind of bone and feather, a 
grand set of feet, and is now in fine 
trim for a successful season. He is 
a son of Handsome Prince, dam Lily 
o' the West, a good show mare by 
Juryman ( 10356). This is one that 
should not fail to prove a winner 
wherever he goes. Democrat, a nice 
smooth, well turned fellow, with fine 
head and neck, good shoulders and 
quarters, lots of bone and a remark­
ably good mover, is by King of the 
Roses, and completes the list of im­
ported horses for sale at the present

Mr. W. D. Flatt, of Hamilton, the 
well known breeder of Shorthorn cat 
tie, can show the visitor a splendid 
•aggregation of choice young stock 
from his imported cows and heifers 
with their first calf. Bred as they 
are. and carefully selected as they 
have been, it is scarcely to be wonder 
cd at if the young stock should com 
prise not only a goodly number of 
real showring goods, but that every 
thing should give ample promise of 
being just what the careful and ex­
perienced breeder wants in his herd 
for breeding stock. At the present 
time Mr. Flatt is fitting out a show- 
herd for Mr. J. Ramsay, of Priddis, 
Alta. The herd will be headed by 
the well known hull Nonpareil Ar­
cher. and will comprise the fine showy- 
red four-year-old cow Carrie Nation. 
Lady Riverside, a red two-year-old. 
a splendid deen. thick and fleshy sen­
ior yearling Village Jcannic, and for 
junior yearling a fine showy red hei­
fer Belinda sih Vs Mr. Flatt docs 
not contemplate showing a herd this 
year, he announces himself willing 
to part with a few real show animals 
that he has in his herd Prospective 
exhibitors would do well to see these

before losing too much time, as there 
are a number of animals, both young 
and nid, whose claim on the colored 
goods will mort than probably be a 
valid one. I'lie line young bull, Ar- 
dlethan Royal, a Princess Royal, 
whose sire is the celebrated bull Ba­
ron Beaufort, and whose dam is con­
sidered to be one of the best breed­
ing cows in Scotland, is now being 
used for service.

As already announced, Mr. F'latt 
will hold an auction sale of Clydes­
dale fillies about the third or fourth 
week m May. and these fillies, care­
fully selected for him by Messrs. 
Montgomery, will be shipped for 
Canada by the first boat.

Mr. D. C Flatt, famous as the 
proprietor of the Millgrovc herd of 
Yorkshire swine, and the most ex­
tensive and enterprising importer of 
that particular breed, is making the 
business boom as hard as ever, and is 
keeping the home herd up to the top 
notch in everything that goes for 
quality and breeding. Pretty well 
sold out of young stock at the pre­
sent time, he has to offer a few good 
young ones only, but his large herd 
of some seventy-five grand breeding 
sows give promise of a plentiful crop 
of youngsters of the popular and pro­
lific kind Two splendid boars are 
at the head of the herd, one a son of 
Dalmeny of Gainsborough, and the 
other by old Duke of York. Mr. 
Flatt will have out this year a really 
sensational show herd of swine, 
among them arc to be seen three 
young hoars, litter brothers, as like 
as three beans and quite as smooth 
and symmetrical, typical all over, and 
really a wonder to look at. No line 
of breeding has been of more actual 
value to the farmer than that of im­
proving the bacon hog, and in this 
good work Mr Flatt has, and is still, 
contributing his full share

The town of Rockland is situated 
within a short distance of the city of 
Ottawa on the Canadian Pacific and 
Canada Atlantic railroads, and has 
for years been famous, not only 
among business men for its lumber 
industry, but among horse, cattle and 
sheep breeders also, for the Pine 
Grove Stork Farm, the home of


