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“ For Christ is the end of the law for righteousness 
to every one that believefh.” He came down from 
above, died, rose again and ascended on high; and it 
it not “ what shall I do to be saved,” but the word 
is nigh thee, even in thy mouth and in thy heart ; 
that is, the word of faith, which we preach ; that if 
thou slialt confess with thy mouth the Lord Jesus, 
and slialt believe in thine heart that God hath raised 
Him from the dead, thou slialt be saved. For with 
the heart man believeth unto righteousness ; and 
with the mouth confession is made unto salvation. 
For the scripture saith, “ Whosoever believeth on 
Him shall not be ashamed. For there is no difference 
between the Jew and the Greek ; for the same Lord 
over all is rich unto all that call upon, Him for who­
soever shall call upon Him shall be saved.”

Light had entered ; her face was bright and ex­
pressed the happiness that was reigning in her heart 
in answer to faith in a risen Christ. She saw the 
mistake in trying to satisfy God with good works for 
peace, but found the secret of His satisfaction in 
Christ’s work for her on the cross ; that she was 
simply to receive God’s righteousness by faith; to 
submit to it as the Prodigal did when he was clothed 
with the “ best robe,” and be attired in what suited 
God.

The sudden relief of this soul is understood by those 
only who have passed through similar exercise. To 
find the worry and misery of over twenty long years of 
sad experience in vain religious efforts for happiness 
vanish in a moment by faith in the Lord Jesus Christ
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