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But r was now about to leave Wanstcad, and,
although delighted to be rid of the surveilance of
a cross old relation, there were some thino-s
which threw an air of sadness occasionally over
my mind. There were many pleasant associa-
tions connected with the place; its beautiful park,
with herds of timid deer grazing under its tall
oaks, upon whose green old heads the sun had
shone for centuries; the venerable mansion, seated
like a queen amid the sylvan scene; the old parish
church, with its gorgeously painted windows, to
which I had often walked on the Sabbath with
my fellow-scholars iu the Sabbath school, and
beside whose deep-toned organ I had sat listening
to the learned priest ; the annual hunt at Easter,m which I had often joined the crew of idle lads
that gave chase to the distracted deer; and the
pleasant walks, made cheerful by the songs of
mnumerable birds, in Epping forest, were alHo be
left—perhaps forever. This thought made me
somewhat sad, but it was swallowed up in the joy
I felt when my mother appeared to conduct me to
Bladen, some sixty miles from London, which
was the place of her ujode since her marriage.

Behold me then, gentle leader, seated with my
mother on the outside of a stage-coach, with some
ten fellow-passengers. The stage-coach of Eng-
land is quite a different vehicle from the carriao-e
known by that name in America. True, it is
drawn by four horses, and it runs on four wheels,
but here the likeness ends ; instead of being built
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