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ment, but being so fuil of misrepre-
sentations, it muet takp ite place
amrongot the flash literature of the
age.

It perhape rnay be the case that
you have been niisinforrned. I trust
that yon have, and that yon can deny
the charge of falsification that rnany
Jay to yen.

ýYou make this etaternent over yonr
own signature:-"lIt ie a weil known
faot here, that the present M. E. Z.
of the G. 0. of Quebea, received his
Mark degree in a lodge that neyer
had a warrant or authority frorn any
-Grand Lodge whatever.

The circular containing that etate-
ment has been sent ail over the land,
and i take thie methodi ta publicly
refute it. Cernp. Hl. L. Robinson re-
ceived hie Mark degree in Lafayette
Chapter, tien and now working under
the juriediction of the Grand Chapter
of Vermont, Match Blet, 1851.

i will forwar profs te, that effect
te any Mark Master mason in good
-standing in Montreal, that you rnay
dlesignate. I say in good standing. I
mean by that, one who ie not sus-
pended.

i arn surprise, that one who claims
te be a Mason, and laye sucli great
stress upon being an Eiglislt.Maso,,
ehould s0 far forget "lthat truth je a
divine attribute and the foundation of
-every virtue." In this instance,
truth seerne ta have been forgotten.

It je currently rnrnored that J. H.
livingston je one of the nom dceilurnes
of a certain individual who je well
known. Whoejver li j, lie lias thus
far succeeded in concealing hie iden-
tity. 1Now, Sir, if yon wiil corne out
-over yonr own signature, as au hon-
orable man and Mason aboula, and
",narne your ma.n," anadh lij found
to be in goocf standing, yen ehll liave
the proofs under the cliapter seal of
LÙafayette Ohapter. If yon still, re-
fuse ta "comae out cf your den," the
whole world must kinow that the iinp
of mierepresentation hadl possession
-of your brain when yen penne that
Îoui elander againet Comp. Rtobinson,

who i s tenfold the peer of the beet of
hie traducers. Aw'aiting your replyi

I remain, truly yailre,
FBi4x W. BaxTERa.

Highgate,'Vt., Oct. 27, 1884.

THE BOND 0F BROTHERHOOD.

The rxilikenees cf Freemaeonry to
any other hurnan society, ana its su-
periority ta thern ail, je exampled in
ne one cf ite characterietios botter
than by its bond cf brotherhood. It
le the Bond cf bonde, and jntroduces
te the Brotherhood cf brotherlicode.
'Tsin h every respect the reverse Of
Shylock's bond, and je ail unwritten.
'Tis a kindred die, an evidence cf the
closeet possible reiationship. Impal-
pable as air, it is yet a tbree-foldl
cord, that je, net qulckiy broken.
Blood cannot inherit it-Freemasonry
jg no society cf the Cincinnati. Our
ue cf descent je rnaintained by cou-

tinuaI accessions cf new maaterial-
the Temple je alwaye building, and
yet neyer compisted. Only the Tem-

~ple net made with bands wiil be per-
fect a flnished.

An eloquent writer lias observedI
that "Ia bond je neoeseary ta cern-
plete our being, only we muet be
carefal that the bond dees net be-
corne bandage." Bath branches of
tis assertion have been abundantly
proved ta be truie. Many are the
bonds voluntarily aseurned by men
for the purpose of adlvancing their
happinese, ana yet how few cf thern
juetify the confidence reposed in
them: That whioh je nsually es.eera-
ea the closeet tie cf ail, vwedlock, how
uselees bas it often proven ta be, to
permanently bina those who enter
into ite bond! When the bond be-
cornes boaage, thon cornes divorce.
FQreomasonry aveide the perile cf thia
tie by ite peculiar usages, proving
theroby meet eonclueively that it la
"la, law tinte itself." Whioe it le true
that lie wlo je once a Freernasan la
always a Freemason, and cannat ab-
salve hiniself from hie voluntarily s-
snrnod obligations, uer obts.ix absolu-


