
measures to ensure that the fissile material from these weapons is rendered 
unusable for weapons purposes. The disposal of weapons-grade plutonium 
deserves particular attention and we encourage its further study. 

5. We are encouraged by the growing international recognition of the need to 
complete without delay universal, comprehensive and verifiable treaties to ban 
nuclear weapons tests and to cut off the production of fissile material for 
nuclear weapons and other nuclear explosive devices. Recognizing the 
continuing dangers posed worldwide by criminal diversion and illicit 
trafficking of nuclear materials, and drawing on the decisions taken in Naples 
and the practical work undertaken by our experts since then, we resolve to 
work together to strengthen systems of control, accounting and physical 
security for nuclear materials; to expand our cooperation in the area of 
customs, law..  enforcement and intelligence and to strengthen through venues 
such as the IAEA and INTERPOL the international community's ability to 
combat nuclear theft and smuggling. We emphasize the importance of bringing 
the Chemical Weapons Convention into force at the earliest possible date, and 
call for rapid progress in developing verification systems for the Biological and 
Toxin Weapons Convention. 

6. The excessive transfer of conventional arms, in particular to areas of 
conflict, is one of our main preoccupations. We are appalled by the continuing 
injuries to civilians caused by anti-personnel landmines. We urge States to 
become party to the 1980 Conventional Weapons Convention and to participate 
in its review conference this fall  in an effort to strengthen multilateral controls 
over anti-personnel landmines. We urge all countries to support full 
implementation of the UN Register of Conventional Arms, and note that 
Article 26 of the UN Charter calls for "the least diversion for armaments of 
the world's human and economic resources". Regional organizations can help 
promote transparency and confidence-building measures that reduce excessive 
stockpiling of conventional weapons. We shall work with others for effective 
and responsible export controls on arms and sensitive dual-use goods and 
technologies. 

Promoting New Approaches 

7. New approaches are needed in the UN and elsewhere to deal with 
emerging global challenges such as environmental degradation, unsustainable 
population growth, mass displacement of victims of conflict and hwoluntary 
migration across borders. Initiatives such as the UN Secretary General's 
Agenda for Development that highlight the linkages between economic, social 
and political issues could make an important contribution to international 
stability. We commit ourselves to working with other Member States to build 
on it. We also recognize the importance of non-governmental organizations in 
the UN's work on economic and social development, including human rights 
and humanitarian assistance, and believe that greater coordination of their 
efforts with those of thé UN and other organizations would .benefit the world 
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