
BALLOT

4. New members shall be elected by ballot 
at any meeting of the Advisory Board composed 
of not less than seven members present. In case 
of an equal division of votes, the Chairman shall 
have a second vote.

OFFICERS

5. There shall be a President, two Vice- 
Presidents, a Secretary and a Treasurer to be 
chosen annually by the Advisory Board, of which 
they shall be members, and in case of dispute, 
they shall be elected by ballot. The officers of 
The Guild shall be the officers of the Board,

ADVISORY BOARD

6. The management of The Guild shall be 
under the exclusive control of an Advisory Board 
composed as follows : —Of six professional men 
and of twelve laymen elected from the members 
at large. The six professional men to be two 
Painters, Sculptors or Designers, two Architects 
or Landscape Architects and two Engineers or 
Land Surveyors. Nine of these members shall 
retire from the Board each year, one each from 
the three professional classes and six laymen. 
The)' shall all be eligible for re-election. There 
shall also be another class of members of the 
Board, viz. :—Representatives (two in number) to 
be appointed annually by such body or organiza­
tion as may be deemed by the Advisory Board to
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