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procedures, course information,
or have questions concerning the
University of Alberta or our
fraternity please feel free to
contact us at: 11027 - 88
Avenue, 439-7955.

Delta Upsilon
We at Delta Upsilon realize

the uncertainties that you have
at this time and durinq the first
year of university life. We have
students withfrom first to four
years of university behind
them who can help you become
oriented to university life.

The fraternity of 1974 is
quite different from its highly
stereotyped counterpart of the
1950's. Gone are the days of
physical hazing.

Many people think that
fraternities will hurt their grades.
This is not generally true. We
admit that some fraternities have
activities that injure grades.
These fraternities are slowly
dying. The majority of
fraternities do not hurt your
grades, but help them. At D.U.
we have men at all levels of
education, and all you have to
do is ask them about your
problems.

At D.U. we
are a non-secret fraternity and
one of the fraternities with the
lowest fees. We try to build a
commitment ~through a
common, positive experience.

For further information,
please contact Bill Tanasichuk at
Delta Upsilon Fraternity, 11142
- 86 Ave., Ph. 433-4518 or
433-5831.

Farmhouse
FarmHouse is the only

fraternity on campus with a
non-Greek name. This is part of

the heritage of FarmHouse
because when it was founded in
1905 in Missouri the first
members were of a rural
background -with but one goal in
mind: to establish a cooperative
living unit with a strong desire
for cooperation, fellowship and
the ungrading of oneself and still
today these are the prime
objectives of FarmHouse.

Living with or being
associated with a group of men
where the bonds of fellowship
are as great as in Farmhouse can
be a great thing during your
University years, and are an even
greater part of your future after
University.
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Our fraternity is very
interested" in building the
all-round man. We have a good
academic. record-and have
academic awards every year.
Books are not everything,
however, and we are involved in
many extracurricular activities
such as. intramural sports and
social clubs and activities.

FarmHouse may have living
spae available for some new
members this fall but we will
certainly be looking forward to
your paying us a visit anyway. If
you are interested, drop in and
see Jim Copeland in Room 557

General Services Building or
leave a message for Bill
MacFarquhar in Room 250
Agriculture Building. We are
looking forward to meeting you
and welcoming you into the
wonderful world of fraternities.

KappaAlphaTheta
Kappa Alpha Theta is going

into its 42nd year of friendship
and tradition on the University
of Alberta campus.

Thetas assist in community
endeavors in many ways:
attending blood donor clinics
and canvassing for the Heart
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Fund. We also helped with craft
projects at the Big Sister
organization. Thetas also
support the Institute of
Logopedics in Wichita, Kansas; a
speech therapy institute utilized
by speech handicapped persons
throughout North America.

ScholasticalHy, Kappa Alpha
Theta strives for good study
habits and high academic ideals.

Actively involved in sports,
the Thetas have achieved more
sports awards than any other
women's fraternity and were
second in the overall intramuraf
standing§ in 1974

Thetas also participate in
exchanges with the 'men's
fraternities. Other social
functions are planned
throughout the year such as a
winter formai, sneaker stomp
and the Steak and Beans dinner,

Women's Fraternities mean
hard work, lots of fun, loyalty
and sisterhood. The friends you
will make will last a lifetime.

- Pi Beta Phi
On a campus of this size,

one can often feel lost and
bewildered. Friendship is very
important, and joining a
fraternity is a solution that
should be considered. We chose
Pi Beta Phi, an international
fraternity of over 110 chapters,
founded at Monmouth College
in 1867.

The goal of our fraternity is
the growth and development of
its members academically,
psychologically, and socially. To
this end, incentives are set up to
encourage studying, and many
methods of increasing morale are
put into effect.

For those interested in
public service, Pi Phi- has four
national philanthropies, and our
chapter tries to become actively
inwolved in community service,
such as the City Life Exposure
Program.

The traditions of our
fraternity are very important to
us and the Pi Bets Cookie Shine
and various gatherings of Alumni
are greatly anticipated. Once or

twice a year, we delve into the
past of our fraternity at the
home of one of pur Charter
Members, Mrs. Hazel Rutherford
McCuaig.

So if you are interested in
broadening your horizons, give
the Greek system a try. We are
located at 11012 - 85 Avenue
(Telephone: 439-0740).

Alpha
Gamma Delta
Alha Gamma Delta is

looking forward to a 'fantastic
year in 1974-75. We are starting
off with moving into a
"new-to-us" house and we hope
to christen it in the traditional
Alpha Gam spirit.

Last year we had a fun-filled
active year. What with studies,
socials, exchanges with men of
other Fraternities such as
hayrides, our formal, Spring Tea,
Parents' Tea, intramurals,
chapter parties (our Suppressed
Desire costume party) and our
altruistic project, we still had
time to build many firnedships
in and outside of our Fraternity.

AGD has a lot to offer. Each
girl is an individual offering
friendship and receiving
friendship. Would you like to
find out more about us? We'd
lil<e to meet you - come visit us!

Alpha Gamma Delta -It's
You!

Delta Gamma
What kind of things can you

get involved in by joining Delta
Gamma? Each year we are
involved in a lot of campus
activities, such as Freshman
Introduction Week, Intramural
sports, and helping to run
Saturday night sociais in CAB.

As a foundation project we
read to the blind students on
campus and we are hoping to
give aid to the elderly in the
coming year.

Why don't you come
out to some of our functions in
September and give us a chance
to show you Delta Gamma.
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South Side

10813-WHYTE AVE
433-4309

North Side:

With us
you don't need a Student Discount

10063 - 105 St.
424-6087

10204- 124 St.
458-3037

We start befow that
Eye Examinations arranged by this office. t Inquire about our all-inclusive contact lens offer.

-f..,
----------


