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PRAYERS

Mr. Leblanc (Laurier), fromn the Standing Committee
on Miscellaneous Estimates, presented the Sixth Report
of the said Committee, which is as follows:

Pursuant to its Order of Reference of Friday, Novem-
ber 19, 1971, your Committee considered the following
Votes, as listed in the Supplementary Estimates (A) for
the fiscal year ending March 31, 1972:

Votes 10a, 20a, and 25a, relating to the Solicitor
General;

Votes la, 5a, 10a, l5a, Ll6a, Ll7a, 20a, 25a, and 30a,
relating to Agriculture;

Votes la, 5a, 15a, 20a, 30a, and L5la, relating to
Energy, Mines and Resources; and

Votes la, 15a, 16a, and Ll9a, relating to Finance.

Your Comimittee commends them to the House.

A copy of the relevant Minutes of Proceedings and
Evidence (Issues Nos. 30, 31, 32 and 33) is tabled.

(The Minutes of Proceedings and Evidence accom-
panying the said Report recorded as Appendix No. 104
to thse Journals).

Mr. Laing (Vancouver South), a Member of the
Queen's Privy Council, laid upon the Table,--Copies of
a Report entitled "Alaska Highway Traffic Study-Sum-
mer 1971" prepared by the Civil Engineering Division,
Department of Public Works of Canada. (English and
French) .- Sessional Paper No. 283-4/44.

Bill C-259, An Act to amend the Income Tax Act and
to make certain provisions and alterations in the statute
law related to or consequential upon the amendments
to that Act, was again considered in Committee of the
Whole and progress having been made and reported, the
Committee obtained leave to consider it again at the
next sitting of the House.

(Proceedings on Adjournment Motion)

At 10.00 o'clock p.m., the question "That this House do
now adjourn'l was deemed to have been proposed pur-
suant to Standing Order 40(1);

After debate the said question was deemed to have
been adopted.


