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SHIRTS,
Button! Collars ■ 
Price..............

If you want to get a chance at the Handsomest NEGLIGEE SHIRTS 
your eyes ever rested up an—come here now and make your selections.*1^#

MEN’S STRIPED 
TUNIC SHIRTS I

/
The man who would like to buy 

a better Shirt for

than lio ever bought before, can get it 
right here. The patterns are choice and 
the Shirt Making, is Excellent and Fabrics 
Fast Color.

Come, Bring Your Best 
$2.00 Thoughts,
$1.60 Pleated Shirts.

If you have worn a poor fitting pleated shirt you know 
the trouble that goes with it, a pleated shirt must be cut to 
fit right. i

(^=“We also, show

W^A JOB LINE &t 69c.
This is all we can say for these shirts—but we would like! to show them to you.

Marshall Bros.
Apply to

Treasuer.
Editor Evening Telegram.

Sir,—Can your furnish me with the 
names of all those appointed by the 
Regatta Committee to collect money 
for this year’s Regatta. Perhaps the 
Committee intend publishing a list of 
subscribers, and it would be only rea­
sonable of the public to expect same.

Yours truly,
SUBSCRIBER.

St. John's, Nfld., Aug. 10th, 1912.
[We would suggest to “Subscribe r” 

to make a personal application to the 
Treasurer, who would be glad, we are 
sure, to furnish him with the infor­
mation he is seeking.—Rd.]

Here and There.

S. A. Congress. On Second Thought.

League Football, Brigade Division, 
Championship, St. George’s Field, (>.30 
tills evening, M. G. B. vs. C. C. C. 

---------o---------
TO LET.—The Duckworth Street 

flat of COLUMBÜS HALL, suitable for 
offices or warerooms. Immediate pos- 
session If desired. Apply to FUR­
LONG & CONROY.—july27,s,tf

TO-NIGHT’S MATCH.— This even­
ing’s football match between the Cad­
ets and Guards promises to be of ex­
ceptional interest. Should the pres­
ent conditions of the weather exist the 
attendance will be the largest for the 
season.

TOBASCO HERE. —The S. S. To- 
basco, Capt. Yeomans reached port 
yesterday forenoon from Liverpool, 
after a passage of eight days. The 
ship was twelve miles off the Narrows 
on Saturday when she ran into a bank 
of fog which detained her. She 
brought 600 tons of cargo but no pas­
sengers.

CAPTAIN BE-IXSTATED. — Capt 
Emrie who was master of the Allan 
Liner Laurentian when she met dis­
aster off Mistaken Point a few years 
ago, and who lost his certificate as a 
result, has just secured a command­
er's ticket again and his many friends 
in St John’s will be pleased. He suc­
ceeds Capt. Hatherley in the Ontarian 
which ie now plying on the River 
Plate, : - "• ;

A lecture in connection with the 
Limitai Congress of the Salvation 
Vrrny took place in the Methodist Col- 
ege Hall at three o’clock yesterday 
lftcrnoou. There was a capacity au- 
li.tnce and Colonel Mapp, who was 
introduced by the Chairman, Hou. S. 
D. Blandford. gave an interesting ad­
dress on “The World Wide Work of 
the Salvation Army." He reviewed 
the. work forty-seven years back from 
the time of General Booth down to 
the present. He stated that the work 
was laid on four platforms: (1) Re­
ligious; (2) Soldai. (3) Temperance, 
(1) Missionary. Since its inception 
he said the Army had gone into 59 
countries, preached in 33 languages, 
had 17,000 officers. 8,000 corps, 22,000 
bandsmen, and 60,000 local officers.

At the close a hearty vote of thanks 
proposed by Rev. Mr. Thackeray and 
seconded by Mr. A. A. Parsons was 
carried by acclamation.

SATURDAY’S MEETING.
The S. A. Citadel, on New Gower 

• Street, was packed on Saturday night 
to welcome Colonel and Mrs. Mapp, 
vbo will conduct the Congress. Brig­
adier Morehan who had charge of the 
meeting introduced Col. Mapp and his 
wife. Adjt. Hiscock, on behalf of the 
Army Officers here extended a wel­
come to the visitors. Col. Mapp re­
plied suitably, referring to his former 
visit here and hoped that the Con­
ferences he was to carry on hero 
would be successful.

FIVE ARRESTS.—The police had it 
fitrly quiet Saturday night and only 
five arrests were made.

BY JAY E. HOUSE.
Meanwhile, the decision of a Kan­

sas judge to the effect that a farmer 
is not necessarily an authority as to 
the mental condition of others, seems 
to he sound, if somewhat daring.

A man can get peady -to go to New 
York in half an hour. But he needs 
two days in which to make his pre 
paration for a fishing trip.

Generally speaking, the breakfast 
table is the dullest place.

Fred Collier wants to know the in­
evitable relation between the tipsy 
male quartette and the lugubrious 
song. We can trace it for him with 
pleasure. The man carrying a "souse1 
never laughs. He either cries oi 
sings, and each manifestation proceeds 
from the same emotion.

The newspapers pay a good deal of 
attention to a murder case if there is 
a young and pretty woman concerned 
in it.

Governor Hadley believes every 
family should keep a cow. Sim Heckli 
is even further advanced along the 
line of progressive ideas. Sitn believes 
that every family should also keep a 
bee. ■ 1

A woman should start on her vaca­
tion trip before the peaches ripen, and 
she should stay away until the canning 
season is over. ,

The hammock has been generally 
superceded by the porch swing, and 
thus matrimony loses another of its 
most efficient assistants.

“I have been granted a parole good 
for three months,” said Buck Kilby 
when he came to work yesterday. "My 
wife has gone to Indiana to spend the 
summer.”

Farewell Service
Of Bet. J. Thackers?.

Yesterday farewell services were 
held at the Congregational Church, 
which bring to an end the 15 years 
pastoral? ol the Rev. J. Thackeray. At 
the morrinp service the Rev. gentle­
man dwelt on leadership in his ser­
mon, taking as his text, “And he led 
them out as far as Bethanv ”

After the service, the members of 
the Deacons Board presented (hé re­
tiring pastor with an address printed 
on white satin, and a handsome silver- 
mounted walking stick, nicely engrav­
ed. The presentation was made by 
Mr. James Warrlcker, and the address 
read by the Secrtary of the Board, Mr. 
David Walker. Mr. Thackeray made 
a suitable reply.

ADDRESS OF DIACONATE.
To Rev. Joseph Thackeray, on the oc­

casion of his- leaving for Canada, 
after a pastorate of 15 years. 

Reverend and Dear Sir,—
The members of the Board of Dea­

cons at present operating in Queen’s 
Road Church, desire to tender their 
united and heartfelt expressions of re­
gard and esteem on this the occasion 
of your leaving Newfoundland to lab­
our In another portion of the Master’s 
vineyard.

Most of us have been associated 
with you in the work of the Diaconate 
for several years, and all of us have 
been closely identified with general 
church work during your entire pas­
torate, and are, therefore, fully con­
scious of the many “ups and downs" 
In church life that have occurred dur­
ing your ministry.

We are also deeply conscious of our 
many shortcomings, not only as mem­
bers of the Diaconate. but as ordinary 
members of this Communion, but de­
sire to assure you—our brother in the 
Master’s work—of our sincere ap­
preciation of the untiring zeal and de­
votion displayed by you in all matters 
pertaining to the spiritual and tem­
poral uplifting of your charge in this 
Colony.

As members of ' the Diaconate, we 
shall miss your genial presence, guid­
ing hand, and kindly counsel and ad­
vice at our future meetings, and. 
whilst we deeply regret your depart­
ure from our shores, we wish to as­
sure you of our united prayers for the 
temporal and spiritual welfare of 
yourself and family, as well as that 
of the Church to which you have been 
■ailed, and finally, may “God be with 
us till me meet again.”

Signed on behalf of the United 
Diaconate,

Yours in the work,
DAVID MARSHALL, 

Secretary.
SC'John’s. Newfoundland,

August 11th, 1912.

EVENING SERVICE.
The evening service was largely at­

tended, many members of other 
churches being present. In making 
the announcements of the week, Mr. 
Thackeray expressed his appreciation 
of the many kindnesses shown to him 
during his pastorate and the harmony 
which had prevailed between himself 
and all classes of the community. For 
his farewell sermon, he took for his 
text :— “And now. Brethren, I com­
mend you to God and tp the Word or 
His Grace, which is able to build you 
up, and to give you an inheritance 
among all them that are satisfied.”

After the sermon. Miss MacKenzic 
sang the sacred solo from Gounod : 
Heart that is weary.”
After the regular service Mr. W. J. 

Barnes, Chairman of the Board of 
Management, presented Mr. Thacker­
ay with an address and a purse of 
gold, in the name of the church and’ 
congregation, as a mark of their ap­
preciation of his services during his 
pastorate. Mr. Thackeray replied and 
the congregation joined in singing, 
God be with you till we meet again.” f
The Benediction brought to a close 

the pastorate of the rev. gentleman.

now enter, may bring to you that 
abounding happiness which - ever in­
creasing usefulness and the joy of 
achievement éffér to those who de­
vote their lives to the emelioratton of 
humanity apcThuman affairs. Is the 
hope and prayer of those with whom 
you have been so long ministered dur­
ing the past fifteen years.

As a slight token of appreciation of 
the valuable service to the Church 
rendered by you during your stay 
amongst us, we ask you to accept the 
accompanying gift, with the sincere 
wishes of the Church and Congrega­
tion for your future welfare.

BAND OF HOPE.
On Saturday afternoon the follow­

ing address was presented to the Rev. 
Mr. Thackeray, from the Band of 
Hope. Accompanying it was a solid 
leather writing case, gold mounted, 
and beautifully engraved.
Dear Mr. Thackeray,—

We arc requested on behalf of the 
officers and members of our Band to 
express to you on the eve of your de­
parture for another sphere of activity, 
our deep sense of regret at the loss 
our Society will sustain by the remov­
al of one who was not only the organ­
izer, hut who has all through been our 
President^ and adviser.

We would ask you to please accept 
the accompanying gift from the Band 
of Hope, and to assure you that we 
shall endeavour to carry on the work 
which you commenced, and which we 
feel has been, and will be lasting 
benefit to the young people of this city 

Yours very sincerely.
. _ LILIAN COWAN,

Visiting Secretary.
BARBARA LANGMEAD, 

Treasurer.
EDITH A. BARNES, 

Secretary.

Backs

Wedding Results in 
Assaott Case.

Victim In Hospital.
A wedding took place at Bay Bulls 

on Friday night last and while the fes­
tivities were being kept up an assault 
case occurred. The victim is Patrick 
Scott who was beaten so badly that he 
had one of Ills legs broken while his 
arms and back were badly bruised 
and showed signs of ill-treatment. 
Scott came here by motor boat Satur­
day afternoon and was brought to thi 
General Hospital in the ambulance 
where lie is being attended to. His 
alleged aggressors—two men—have 
been summoned and will be tried to­
day at Bav Bulls by the local justice 
of the peace. Mr. W. J. Higgins left 
town by can iage last night to defend 
the accuse 1.

An Anthem to Order.
Lord Kitchener on one occasion in­

vented a national anthem. It was up­
on the occasion of a visit to India of 
the Ameer of Afghanistan, and the 
bands were to greet him with the na­
tional anthem, of Afghanstan. But no 
one kriéw what it was, and Lord Kit­
chener was appealed to.

“What does it matter two straws ?" 
he said. “Play a bar or two of some­
thing slow and pompous and let it go 
at that.”

So the first band that greeted the 
Ameer played a march from one of the 
German operas very slowly and sol- 
ettinly. artd this wds ieliefaily taken 
up by the whole of (So bauds in India,

ADDRESS.
To the Rev. Joseph Thackeray,

St. John’s.
Reverend and Dear Sir,—

As members of the church and con 
gregation, we cannot allow the assoc­
iation of so many .years to come to a 
termination without an expression of 
appreciation of your work in the 
Church over which you have so long 
presided.

Not only in this church, but 
throughout the city, and the Island as 
well, your influence for good has 
been felt. In the work of Temperance 
and Moral Reform, the earnestness 
displayed by you is not alone matter 
of honourable record, but has been 
abundant in its uplifting of our people 
and to the individual.

Your sympathy, so generous and 
practical in its demonstration, has 
wrought happiness in many a home, 
where, so long as life shall remain, 
your name will be held in. love and 
admiration.

In the new sphere of toll to which 
you go, you will carry the prayers and 
praise of many who during your min­
istry in this country, have realized 
that in you they have had a very true 
friend, and one whose heart has ever 
responded to the cry of the sad, the 
suffering and the sorrowing.

That the wider life, on which you

Seamen’s
Institute. I

SUBSCRIPTIONS.
Towards the final completion of the 

King George V. Seamen’s Institute, to 
Aug. 10, 1912: —

Mr. John Browning, $500.00; Friends 
through the ‘Association Men,’ New 
York, $60.00; Dr. W. T. Grenfell, C 
M G., $100.00; ’Pilgrim Press,’ Bos­
ton, for a narrative written by Dr. 
Henry Van Dyke, and published in 
‘The Congregationalist, and Christian 
World,’ $25.00. Total, $685.00.

Booth Co. m
Newfoundland.

Canadian even more than New­
foundland fishing interests are watch­
ing closely the fishing experiments 
being carried on by the Booth Fisher­
ies Co. in Newfoundland Waters just 
now. It is understood the big concern 
has set aside $25,000 for these experi­
ments. The company is using three 
Ashing vessels, the El va L. Spurting, 
a gasoline power craft; the Edward 
Black and the Ida Campbell. The 
Spurting has cruised the Banks from 
Ramea to Port au Port, seeking cod 
and halibut; the Edward Black direct 
from Portland recently, was sent to 
Bonne Bay and further north on a 
similar quest, and the Campbell is at 
Bay of‘Islands gill net fishing.

A. W. Piccott, Minister of Marine 
and Fisheries, recently returned from 
a visit to the Booth fishing fleet. He 
is eager, it is said, to see the oper­
ations of the Booth concern extended 
to Nova Scotia waters. The Spurting 
landed him at Port aux Basques and 
forwarded her catch of halibut in cold 
storage cars to Boston, Mass. It is 
probable another month of experi­
menting will be required, according to 
Minister Piccott, before the company 
reaches a decision about continuing 
fishing in these waters on a large 
scale. Capt. O'Neil, master of the 
Spurting, is said to have jigged hali­
but in 15 fathoms of water at Port au 
Port with a handline from the ship's 
deck, and brought up specimens 
weighing 250 pounds. One of the sail­
ors from a dory by the ship’s side also 
caught halibut equally as large.—N. 
Y. Fishing Gazette, Aug. 3.

with Newfoundland than with Quebec 
and under the arrangement suggested 
it would have been Newfoundland, not 
Quebec, that would have had to pen­
etrate it with railways. Doubtless, 
politicians will think It very silly to 
call that an advance. What can be 
better (or a government than the 
building of a railway? Whether it is 
built by the government itself or by a 
company, the possibilities of patron­
age and of consequent political sup­
port are very great. What govern­
ment would not want a railway to 
build? True, but we are not thinking 
of governments but of the taxpayers. 
Except as a place to spend money in, 
Ungava will be of small use to any­
body for a good while. The love of 
possession is. however, great. New­
foundland which has a population 
about half of that of Montreal, and an 
area small, compared with that of 
most of the provinces, might look 
upon union with Canada as accepting a 
very subordinate place. The accession 
of this big territory would have been 
something of temptation. However, 
that opportunity is post.—Montreal 
Witness.

Tit For Tat.

“ Bayman.”
Editor Evening Telegram.

Dear Sir,—I was glad to read thi 
note of “Bayman” in your morning 
contemporary to-day, and would like 
to add a tine in support of his re­
quest. that the Reid Nfld. Co. issue 
excursion rates from Tuesday to 
Thursday of this week. Harbor Grace 
is a very large contributor to the 
Company in the way of freight and 
passenger traffic, and every induce­
ment ought to be given to attract vis­
itors to the town on its one great 
"Derby” Day.

Trusting that the R. N. Co. may be 
able to see its way clear to grant this 
privilege to the public without serious 
loss to themselves.

I remain your truly.
ANOTHER BAYMAN.

St John's. Aug. 12. 1912.

A Boundary
Question.

Now that Ungava has fallen to 
Quebec, the long unsettled question 
of the boundary between Canada and 
Newfoundalnd has to be faced. Boun­
dary questions are generally histori­
cal—have to be determined by the 
interpretation of past conventions. In 
so far as that is the case, the obvious 
means of settlement is an impartial 
court of adjudication. We do not 
know that in this case there is much 
historical material to work upon. If 
that is lacking, the settlement will 
have to be one of mutual agreement, 
and we should advise generosity on 
the part of Canada and Quebec. We 
should not, indeed, have objected if 
there had been no such boundary to 
settle. If Ungava had been given to 
Newfoundland as a marriage jointure 
to get that ilaovince into the Domin­
ion, the Province of Quebec would not 
have been a whit the poorer. Indeed 
we would have been, for a good while 
at least, better off. All the coast and 
inland conditions of the Labrador 
Peninsula are far more of a piece

Lord Charles Beresford whose let­
ters to the newspapers on the subject 
of our Naval supremacy, have again 
caused a good deal of discussion, lias 
been described as being the typical 
British sailor, both in manner and ap­
pearance.

He once delivered an important 
political speech at York, and at tIn­
close of the meeting a well-known 
politician, notorious for having 
changed political sides repeatedly, 
came to congratulate him.

“That was an admirable speech. 
Beresford," Ire said effusively. "Cap­
ital ! I didn’t think you could do it."

"You flatter me,” said Lord Charles 
coldly.

“Not a bit," was the reply. “And 
the extraordinary thing is that you 
don't look a bit like a politician, you 
know.”

"No, nor do you look like a weather 
cock." retorted Lord Charles bluntly.

Another Case 
of Infanticide.

Another case of infanticide has 
been brought to tight in which an in­
fant child was found buried in a 
graveyard without anyone’s know­
ledge of its being there. Yesterday 
the police arrested a young woman as 
a suspect. The prisoner has not been 
asked to plea dto the charge and is 
remanded pending evidence.

REGATTA COMMITTEE MEETS— 
A meeting of the Regatta Conmiitlce 
will be held in Wood’s West End 
Restaurant to-night when some im­
portant business will be disposed of. 

-------o---------
FOR ERNA. — Some young ladies 

and gentlemen will proceed to Habor 
Grace and Carbonear next week to 
give a concert and theatricals for the 
benefit of the Marine Disaster Fund.

TIS

SO A V,
WE HAVE IT.

Prices and Samples on application.

G. M. BARR, Agent,
augg.cocl Wm. Gossage * Sons, Ltd.

TINNED SALMON !
THIS SEASON’S PACK.

SfRRftVAt.LO’8 T0#IC
Aik jiir Drwgght fit 
(Berk art I roe Wise).

Cum:
ANAEMIA, CHLOROSIS, DEBILITY

Oemrtiffni
THE SOUVENIR HOUSE! Trap- 

noil’s, 197 Water Street. All kinds I 
Enamels, Labradorite, Model Seals, [ 
etc.—july 18, tf.

Choice No. 1 Salmon
Put up by a Reliable Packer. Prices Right.

A. H. MURRAY, 0’Dwyer’s Cove.
f

Marine Disaster Fund.
To amount acknowledged . .$15,355.04 

(Treasurer’s Statement.)
Rev. P. J. O’Brien. P. P.,

Tor’s Cove, and parishion­
ers, Sunday's Collection. . 75.00

Rev. William Swann, St.
George’s, Meth. Church, «
Boswarles, Port au Port. . 9.25 I

$15,439.29

HINARD’8 LINIMENT 
MAN’S EMEND.

cheap FimitmntE.
There is all the difference in the world between cheap furniture, that is 

inferior goods at cheap price, and first quality goods at cheap prices. Wo 
are showing many new designs in Buffets, Sideboards and Dressers at prices 
which cannot be beaten for tike quality goods.

BAMBOO.
netsf Flower Sfauds’ TaMeS’

WICKER.
„ Goods in great variety, and newest designs: Cake Stands, Càairs,
Music Stands, tall «rt inspect whHe our stock Is luge,

CALLAHAN, CLASS 6 Çd., OiicMIl M 6mr $6.

Cleairi
OF S

MUSLINS
this week

HENRY
LOT 1.-400 YARDS

FANCY Colol
Regular value. 12< .I'm- 9c. pi

LOT 2.—500 yards, includes ( oli i 
Lawns and Fancy Zephyrs. 

LOT 8.—500 yards Fancy Muslin . 
value. 18c., for 12c. yard.

LOT 4__1,000 yards, includes Fail
laines, in plain, si i f
15c. yard.

THIS WEEK'S

MERCERIS!
LOT 1.—500 yards, in White. < 

Black. Regular value. I lie.. 
LOT 2.—450 yards, in White lilac! 

Cream and Navy: very silky i.
now 15c. per yard.

LOT 3.—550 yards Colored Mercci 
pagne. Pale Blue, Pink. Rest 
25c„ for 20c. per yard.

LOT 4.—200 yards 4-1 inch ( uliu 
Blue and Pink only. Regular
4 ends Colored American < 

Pink and Crimson. Regular vain- 
Clearing lois in Check Zepliy i 

wear, at 10e., 12c.. and 15c. per >;
Also Plain Colored Zephyr- in 

per yard.
Special values in lire-- (an- 

Blue and Pink, at 16c.. I sc.. 20c.
A very fine lot Mccccri-cil Hr

and 35c. per yard.

SEE WINDOW !

Henry
Experiments on 
Human Heim’s 
have proved the 
body - building 
power of Box ril 
to be from 10 to 
20 times the 
amount taken.

T. J. EDENS, So

We are now showing

Lawn En 
and Inset

These goods are all of aj 
we have priced them all 
give the Ladies a chance 
mer’s amount of these excr

See our Window „é «
G. T. HI

367 and 148 Duckwl

I KEEP
>1 88

1 $10.50, 13.0\
i

GENTS’
GENTS

$7.\
} r

AT

ft

§j G. F. KEARNEY.

ih
1


