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CHAP. IV.
AN AC T to continue the Expiring Laws.

[Passed 12th January, 1838.]

W HEREAS it is necessary, under the peculiar-circumstances of the
Province at this time, to continue, by one Act, all Laws about to expire r e
at the close of the present Session of the Provincial Legislature: Be it
therefore enacted by the Queen's most Excellent Majesty, by and with the
advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Assembly of the Pro-
vince of Upper Canada, constituted and assembled by virtue of and under
the authority of an Act passed in the Parliament of Great Britain, entitled,
" An Act to repeal certain parts of an Act passed in the fourteenth year
of His Majesty's reign, entitled, 'An Act for making more effectual pro-
vision for the Government of the Province of Quebec, in North America,
and to make further provision for the Government of the said Province,"
and by the authority of the same, That all Laws expiring at the close of exlirlnà a

the present Session of the Legislature, be and the same are hereby re- conued until close ut

vived and continued, until the close of the next ensuing Session of Parlia-
ment, and no longer.

CHAP. V.

AN A CT to regulate the future crection of Gaols in this Province.

[Passed I2th January, 1838.]

WHEREAS it is expedient that measures should be taken for ascer-r
taining and determining upon the plan of a Gaol, which will be best
adapted to insure the health and comfort, as well as the safe custody of
the Prisoners to be confined therein, in order that by the adoption of such
plan in the first instance, the expense of future alterations may be avoided,
and much unnecessary suffering prevented: Be it therefore enacted by
the Queen's niost Excellent Majesty, by and with the advice and consent
of the Legislative Council and Assembly of the Province of Upper Canada,
constituted and assembled by virtue of and under the authority of an Act
passed in the Parliament of Great Britain, entitled, "An Act to repeal
certain parts of an Act passed in the fourteenth year of His Majesty's
reign, entitled, 'An Act for making more effectual provision for the
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