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ject of the registration of land, it iiever wlll be publiohed."
queen Elizabeth in the Parliament 6f 1597 assented to, forty-
three Bis, publie and private, and rejeeted fort.y-eight that had
passed- -bth Houfes. James I., ini assenting -ta ail the f ills. of
the session, explairied that lie did s0 " as a special token of grace
and favour, being a inatter unusual to pais ail Acta without any
exception." Âlthotigh the Stuarts preferred ta -urne the dis-
penoing power and lightly assented ta Bils that they neyer in-
tended ta observe, yet the close of their system brought 1,ack the
use of the aid prerogative. On four important occasions, and
once afterwards on a matter of less moment, William III. de-
clined ta sanction Bis. Once, and once only, after his death,
when Queen Aune vetoed the Seottish Alilitia Bull under peeu-
liar circumatances and in conformity ta the wishes of bath
Hou8es, were the words La Reine s'avisera heard in Parliament.
-Law Tines.

POSSESS<ION AS A ROOT OP TJTLE.

In these days when nearly every transaction coninected with
land is committed to writing there is a tendency t'c overlook the
importance attached by the law te, iere possession, but neyer-
theleas possession stili remains a root cf tîtie. lu very early
days, no doubt, possession was practieally the only titie ta land;
he wvas the owner who, with his retainers, wvas strong enough ta
take, and then ta retain, possession. Anid in the more civilized
of ancient cammunities land wu. transferred frain on1e persan to
another by physk possession being given in the presence of
witnesses. A record of what was donc iniglit be drawni up and
signed, as La the case of livery of seisin, but the writing did not
constitute the titie ta the land; it was inerely evidence lu sup-
port cf the titie.

If a persan to-day entera upou and takes possession af a
parcel. of land, without any titie or even colour of titie thereto,
but merely as a wrongdoer, what is his position in the eyes, of
the lawt At firat no doubt lie la a mere trespasser, aud could


