
THE PRESBYTERIAN RECORD.

WORIC IN THE F-RESBYTERY 0F
QUEBEC.

Astrenuous effort is being made to increase the
circulation of the PRESBYTERIAN RECORD in
the Presbytery of Quebec. To this end pro-
posais have been entertained to secure a spe
cial edf/iion for circulation throughout the
Presbytery, in which one page monthly wili be
secured for the insertion of local matter sup-
piied by the Presbytery. This impiies an an-
nual additional cost Of $3o. The managers of
the RECORD, however, have offered to carry
out this arrangement free of extra charge on
condition that one thousand more copies are
taken in the Presbytery. The statement which
follows was forwarded to us as the first Quebec
page, and we send it out to the 'viole Church
as a sampie of what is intended to be done by
th is Presbytery. If there are any other Presbyte-
ries like-minded, we shall be giad to hear from
them witiout deiay. 0f course, in the event
of this plan being adopted, the speciai page,
which would occupy the first page of the
RECORD, wouid only reacli the congregations
within the bounds of the Presbytery in whose
interests it is pubiished. The new departure
wiii complicate our office work to some extent,
but we are willing to adopt any method that
shahl secure the greatest amount of good to
the greatest number.-EDITORS.

" The Augmentation Scheme lias been fairiy
launched in our district. Rev. R. H. Warden
attended the late Presbytery meeting in Que-
bec, and fuily expiained that the object con-
templated is to raise every minister's salary up
to $75o and a manse. To entitie a congrega-
tion to aid, however, it must give its minister
at Icast, $4o0 and a manse, and contribute at
the rate of not iess than $4.50' a year, percommunicant. To secure this, the aid-needing
congregations wiii have, in every case, to add
considerabiy to their present contributionsyand the congregations flot needing aid are
expected to increase their present contribu-
tions A Cominittee of Presbytery lias been
appointed, consisting of Messrs. Amaron,
Dewey and Pritchard, to attend to the work.
Already Kinnear's Milis lias been visited when
the congregation raised its salary to the mini-
xnum without any aid from the scheme. St.
Sylvester and Lower Leeds were also visited,
when $70 was at once added to Mr. Pritciard's
saiary, entitling his congregation to come onthe Fund. Other congregations are being

visited, of whom we expect to have good
tidings next month.

Morrin Coliege is in a very gratifying condi-
tion this year. Every room irn the college is
occupicd. There are nineteen regular stu-
dents in attendance. Three of these are in the
Theologicai departmnent, and sixteen aie tak--
ing the Arts course, and working for a degree.
Four, if flot five, of these have aiready signified
their intention of studying for the ministry.
When congregations are apportioning their
benevolent contributions, it is hoped, that they
wili remember that iast June the General As-
sembly unanimously and most cordially
Cirecommended" the congregations of our
Presbytery to send their gifts for college
purposes to Morrin Coliege, as ivorthy of ail
support and as having a speciai dlaim on our
own people. XVill congregations bear this in
mind, and send their gifts to Rev. J. C. Catta-
nach, Treasurer for the Presbytery ?

A few weeks agyo, the Rev. Dr. Wardrope of
Guelph, the convener of tue Assernbly's
Foreig-n Mission Committee, visited Quebec
and addressed the students of Morrin Coliege
on the dlaims of the Foreign Mission field.
Since then, the Rev. Il. A. Robertson of
Eromanga has visited the Presbytery and
addressed meetings at Richmond, Kingsbury,
Sherbrooke, Three Rivers and Quebec, having
very large audiences on every occasion and
awakening a deep interest in Foreign Mission
wvork and in Eromanga in particular. Such
vigits bring mission work before our congre-
gations in a mnanner that is most impressive.
Our interest in the lopxeiy Eromanga mission-
ary is deeper than ever, now that we have
seen and heard him.

Sherbrooke congregation is considering the
question of a new church building, h ence the
the L adies Aid Society recently held a musical
festival and sale, which yielded a handsomne sum
for the new church. Mr. Cattanach lias lately
opened a brandi Sabbath-school in the town-
ship of Ascot, under the superintendence of
Mr. Robt. Eadie, with very encouraging pro-
spects.

Riic/irondSabbath-schooî is larger than ever
hitherto. Mr. Dewey lias lately commenced
two newv preaching stations within the bounds
of the congregation. .4fassawz5pi, Richby and
Goaticooke are being supplied this wvinter by
the Montreai College M issionary Association.
The work of gathering in and building up is
progressing very favorably. Mr. J. Woodside,
Coaticooke, is the ruling eider.

Quebec.-Rev. Dr. Cook is supplying St.
Andrew's pulpit for the present. Chlmers'
Church 'viii introduce the hymnai into public
worship at the New-Year.
a zes.-- Plans for the new church have been
ladbefore the congregation. The building

wiii be commenced in spring, while a soial
wili be heid about the New-Year.
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